Defense Depot Memphis Tennessee Information Repository (IR) Compilation Index 2025

IR Index Section #	IR Index Section Category
1	Administrative Record (AR) Site File Index/Information Respository Index
2	New AR Documents
3	Guidance Documents/Regulations
4	Community Involvement
4.1	Community Involvement Plans (CIP)/Community Relations Plans (CRP)
4.2	Community Involvement Correspondence
5	Press Releases/Advertisements/Newspaper Articles
5.1	Press Releases
5.2	Advertisements
5.3	Newspaper Articles
6	Newsletters/EnviroNews
7	Fact Sheets
7.1	Fact Sheets
7.2	Letters to Residents - Fact Sheets
8	Restoration Advisory Board (RAB)/Public Meetings/RAB Correspondence
8.1	Restoration Advisory Board (RAB)/Public Meetings
8.2	RAB Correspondence
9	Site Background/Site Management/Notice of Land Use Restrictions
9.1	Site Background/Site Management
9.2	Notice of Land Use Restrictions
10	BRAC Cleanup/Site Management Team Meeting Summaries
11	Five Year Reviews
12	Annual BRAC Cleanup/Site Management Plans
13	Risk/Health Assessments
14	Proposed Plans And Decision Documents
14.1	Main Installation
14.2	Dunn Field
15	Annual Land Use Controls Inspections/Long Term Monitoring
15.1 15.2	Annual Land Use Controls Inspections Main Installation Long Term Monitoring Reports
15.2	Dunn Field Long Term Monitoring Reports
15.4	Site-Wide Long Term Monitoring Reports
16	Removal Actions/Remedial Actions Reports
16.1	Main Installation
16.2	Dunn Field
16.3	Groundwater Interim Remedial Action
17	Remedial Design
17.1	Main Installation
17.2	Dunn Field
18	Remedial Investigations/Supplemental Investigation Reports
19	Feasibility Studies
20	Additional Site Studies

Defense Depot Memphis Tennessee Information Repository (IR) Compilation Index 2025

IR Index Section #	IR Index Section Category
21	Work Plans
21.1	Main Installation
21.2	Dunn Field
22	Base Realignment and Closure Documents
23	Findings Of Suitability to Transfer (FOST)/Transfer Deeds
23.1	Findings Of Suitability to Transfer (FOST)
23.2	Transfer Deeds
24	Findings Of Suitability to Lease (FOSL)
25	Quality Assurance/Quality Control Plans
26	Boring Logs And Well Diagrams

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
1		Administrative Record (AR) Site File Index/Information Repositor	ry (IR) Index		
1	4-Mar-25	DDMT Administrative Record Index-2024	HDR	1	1.1
1	4-Mar-25	DDMT Administrative Record Compilation Index-2024	HDR		1.2
1	4-Mar-25	DDMT Information Repository Compilation Index-2024	HDR		1.3
2		New AR Documents			
2	1-Mar-25	2024 Annual Site Inspection Report, Revision 1	HDR	1631	
2	1-Mar-25	2025 Site Management Plan, Final	HDR	1632	
2	11-Mar-25	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, March 2025	HDR	1633	
2	26-Mar-25	EPA Letter Regarding Approval of Draft Final 2025 Site Management Plan	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1634	
2	8-Apr-25	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, April 2025	HDR	1635	
2	13-May-25	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 2025	HDR	1636	
2	10-Jun-25	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, June 2025	HDR	1637	
2	14-Jul-25	EPA Email Regarding Follow Up on July 14, 2025 Site Management Team Monthly Call	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1638	
2	12-Aug-25	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, August 2025	HDR	1639	
2	28-Aug-25	EPA Letter Proposing Extensions for Main Installation Documents	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1640	
3		Guidance Documents/Regulations			
3	1-Oct-88	Guidance for Conducting Remedial Investigations and Feasibility Studies Under CERCLA	Environmental Protection Agency		3.7
3	1-Dec-89	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume I Human Health Evaluation Manual Part A	Environmental Protection Agency		3.8
3	1-Oct-91	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume I Human Health Evaluation Manual Part C - Risk Evaluation of Remedial Alternatives	Environmental Protection Agency		3.9

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
3	1-Dec-91	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume I Human Health Evaluation Manual Part B - Development of Risk-Based Preliminary Remediation Goals	Environmental Protection Agency		3.10
3	1-Sep-93	USEPA Superfund Technical Assistance Grants	Environmental Protection Agency	40	3.11
3	1-Feb-00	DoD Technical Assistance for Public Participation Handbook	Department of Defense		3.4
3	1-Dec-01	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume I Human Health Evaluation Manual Part D - Standardized Planning, Reporting, and Review of Superfund Risk Assessments	Environmental Protection Agency		3.12
3	1-Dec-01	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume III Human Health Evaluation Manual Part A - Process for Conducting Probabilistic Risk Assessment	Environmental Protection Agency		3.13
3	1-Jul-04	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume I Human Health Evaluation Manual Part E - Supplemental Guidance for Dermal Risk Assessment	Environmental Protection Agency		3.14
3	19-Jan-06	Department of Defense (DoD)/USEPA Joint Guidance on Streamlined Site Closeout and NPL Deletion Process For DoD Facilities	Department of Defense/ Environmental Protection Agency		3.6
3	1-Jan-09	Risk Assessment Guidance for Superfund (RAGS) Volume I Human Health Evaluation Manual Part F - Supplemental Guidance for Inhalation Risk Assessment	Environmental Protection Agency		3.15
3	1-Aug-11	This is Superfund: A Community Guide to EPA's Superfund Program	Environmental Protection Agency		3.16
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Bioremediation (EPA 542-F-12-003)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.17
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Excavation of Contaminated Soil (EPA 542-F-12-007)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.18
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to In Situ Thermal Treatment (EPA 542-F-12-013)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.19

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Monitored Natural Attenuation (EPA 542-F-12-014)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.20
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Pump and Treat (EPA 542-F-12-017)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.21
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Soil Vapor Extraction and Air Sparging (EPA 542-F-12-018)	Agency		3.22
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Thermal Desorption (EPA 542-F-12-020)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.23
3	1-Sep-12	A Citizen's Guide to Vapor Intrusion Mitigation (EPA 542-F-12-021)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.24
3	1-Jan-16	Superfund Community Involvement Handbook	Environmental Protection Agency		3.25
3	29-Jan-18	Comprehensive Environmental Response, Compensation, and Liability Act (CERCLA) and Federal Facilities Overview	Environmental Protection Agency		3.26
3	4-Jun-18	Introduction to the Hazard Ranking System (HRS)	Environmental Protection Agency		3.27
3	31-Aug-18	DoD Defense Environmental Restoration Program Manual	Department of Defense		3.5
3	2-Apr-19	National Oil and Hazardous Substances Pollution Contingency Plan (NCP) Overview	Environmental Protection Agency		3.28
3	16-Sep-19	40 Code of Federal Regulations (CFR) Part 300 – National Oil and Hazardous Substances Pollution Contingency Plan (NCP)	Code of Federal Regulations		3.1
3	16-Sep-19	42 U.S. Code Chapter 103 – CERCLA	United States Code		3.2
3	16-Sep-19	42 U.S. Code Chapter 116 – Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA)	United States Code		3.3
4		Community Involvement			
4.1		Community Involvement Plans/Community Relations Plans			
4.1	1-May-93	Draft Final Community Relations Plan, RI Follow-On Study	Engineering-Science, Inc.	34	
4.1	1-Jun-97	Draft Community Relations Plan	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	250	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
4.1	3-Dec-97	Frontline Communications Focus Group Report, 25 Nov 97	Trust Marketing and Communications, Inc.	271	
4.1	1-Mar-98	Interim Community Relations Plan	U.S. Army Center for Health Promotion and Preventive Medicine/Frontline Corporate	289	
4.1	13-May-98	Focus Group Letter to USACE and Frontline Concerning Survey Results Report	Santos, Susan L McCallum, David B Focus Group	313	
4.1	1-Sep-98	Draft Final Community Relations Plan		351	
4.1	1-Jun-99	Community Relations Plan	/U.S. Army Center for Health	425	
4.1	1-Dec-04	Community Involvement Plan	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	818	
4.1	1-Jul-09	Off-Depot Groundwater Remedial Action Soil Vapor Monitoring Community Relations Plan	HDR/e2M	1515	
4.1	1-Apr-11	Community Involvement Plan Rev. 1	HDR	1066	
4.1	1-Dec-20	2020 Community Involvement Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1509	
4.2		Community Involvement Correspondence			
4.2	1-Aug-93	Depot Letter to MSPJC Concerning Public Exhibition and Discussion of Site Restoration	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	449	
4.2	8-Apr-94	MSPJC Letter to Depot Concerning Applications for Citizen Review Committee	Larry Smith Mid-South Peace and Justice Center	452	
4.2	6-Jun-94	MSPJC Letter to Depot Concerning Review of Draft HSP, Technical Report, Generic QAPP, Generic RI/FS Work Plan, FSP, and Site Management Plan	Larry Smith Mid-South Peace and Justice Center	63	
4.2	27-Oct-94	ATSDR Letter to Depot Concerning RAB Presentation and Site Visit	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	82	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
4.2	6-Jun-95	MSPJC Letter to Depot Concerning Chemical Warfare Constituents, Dunn Field	Larry Smith Mid-South Peace and Justice Center	114	
4.2	22-Jan-96	MSPJC Letter to CH2M Hill Concerning Background Study Summary Sheets	Larry Smith Mid-South Peace and Justice Center	145	
4.2	23-Jan-96	Depot Letter to Survival Politics Unlimited Concerning Public Disclosure of Documents	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	524	
4.2	18-Jul-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Representative Concerning Environmental Injustices at Depot	Kenneth Bradshaw Doris Bradshaw Depot Concerned Citizens Committee	170	
4.2	18-Jul-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning Request for Poison Signs	Kenneth Bradshaw Doris Bradshaw Depot Concerned Citizens Committee	171	
4.2	18-Jul-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning Request for Poison Signs	Kenneth Bradshaw Doris Bradshaw Depot Concerned Citizens Committee	172	
4.2	20-Jul-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning Request for Files Relating to Pollution, Hazardous Waste, and Environmental Violations	Kenneth Bradshaw Doris Bradshaw Depot Concerned Citizens Committee	173	
4.2	20-Aug-96	Depot Letter to Depot-CCC Concerning Request for Files Relating to Pollution, Hazardous Waste, and Environmental Violations	Dorian P. Amido Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	177	_

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
4.2	29-Aug-96	Depot Letter to Depot-CCC Concerning Request to Place Poison Signs Along Depot and Drainage Ditches	Michael J. Kennedy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	178	
4.2	10-Sep-96	Depot-CCC Memorandum Concerning Request for Files Relating to Pollution, Hazardous Waste, and Environmental Violations	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	180	
4.2	12-Sep-96	Depot Letter to Depot-CCC Concerning Request for Files Relating to Pollution, Hazardous Waste, and Environmental Violations	Dorian P. Amido Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	181	
4.2	1-Oct-96	USEPA Letter to ME3 Concerning RAB Regulations	Tiki Whitfield Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	187	
4.2	22-Oct-96	Depot-CCC Letter to HQ USEPA Concerning Chemical Warfare Hazards at Depot	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	190	
4.2	22-Oct-96	Information Act and Request for Information	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	191	
4.2	22-Oct-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning Request for Files Relating to Chemical Warfare Service	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	192	
4.2	5-Nov-96	USACE Letter to Depot Concerning IRP Fact Sheets	John Matthews U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	194	
4.2	22-Nov-96	TDEC Letter to Resident Concerning Environmental Cleanup Concerns	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	196	
4.2	26-Nov-96	Depot Letter to Depot-CCC Concerning Request for Files Relating to Chemical Warfare Service	Dorian P. Amido Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	197	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
4.2	30-Dec-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning Administrative Record and Public Participation	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	199	
4.2	30-Dec-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning RAB Membership Diversity	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	200	
4.2	30-Dec-96	Depot-CCC Letter to Depot Concerning Request for Laws that Govern Toxic and Hazardous Waste	Kenneth Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	201	
4.2	22-Jan-97	Depot Letter to Depot-CCC Concerning Requests for Information and RAB Membership	Michael J. Kennedy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	205	
4.2	10-Mar-97	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning RAB and Comments on Letter to Newspaper	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	220	
4.2	18-Apr-97	MHC and Depot-CCC Letter to ATSDR Concerning Health Assessment for Community Surrounding Depot	Alan Ball Doris Bradshaw Memphis Health Center, Inc.	235	
4.2	30-Apr-97	ATSDR Letter to Depot-CCC Concerning Health Assessment and Future Health Concerns	Rueben Warren Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	237	
4.2	30-Apr-97	ATSDR Letter to Church Concerning Health Assessment and Future Health Concerns	Rueben Warren Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	238	
4.2	30-Apr-97	ATSDR Letter to Senator Concerning Health Assessment and Future Health Concerns	Rueben Warren Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	239	
4.2	30-Apr-97	ATSDR Letter to MHC Concerning Health Assessment and Future Health Concerns	Rueben Warren Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	240	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
4.2	30-Apr-97	ATSDR Letter to Representative Concerning Health Assessment and Future Health Concerns	Rueben Warren Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	241	
4.2	30-Apr-97	ATSDR Letter to TDH Concerning Health Assessment and Future Health Concerns	Rueben Warren Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	242	
4.2	12-May-97	ATSDR Letter to Depot-CCC and MHC Concerning Adverse Health Effects Associated with Hazardous Waste	Barry Johnson Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	247	
4.2	23-May-97	HQ DLA Memorandum for Record Concerning Meeting with Concerned Citizens Community	Jan B. Reitman HQ DLA-CAAE	249	
4.2	11-Dec-97	Depot Memorandum for Record Concerning Depot-CCC Meeting, 08 Dec 97	Denise Cooper K The Memphis Depot	275	
4.2	23-Jun-98		Sandee L. Coulberson Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	323	
4.2	24-Jun-98	Denot-CCC Letter to SEAF Concerning Request for Representative to	Doris Bradshaw Depot- Concerned Citizens Committee	324	
4.2	2-Jul-98	ATSDR Letter to Depot Concerning Relationship with Other Government Organizations and Community Involvement	Michael J. Grayson Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	332	
4.2	13-Jun-03	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Kids and Chemical-Facts of Law	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	739	
4.2	11-Jul-03	Memphis and Shelby County Health Department Letter to Depot Concerning Public Comment on Dunn Field Proposed Clean-up Plan	Yvonne Madlock Memphis and Shelby County Health Department	751	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5		Press Releases/Advertisements/Newspaper Articles			
5.1		Press Releases			
5.1	23-Jul-93	Press Release, Public Exhibition and Discussion, 10 Aug 93	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	445	
5.1	10-Aug-93	Press Release, Public Exhibition and Discussion of Installation Environmental Restoration Activities	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	442	
5.1	1-Jan-96	Press Release, Public Notice, Installation of Off-Base Monitoring Wells	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	138	
5.1	2-Jan-96	Press Release, Installation of Monitoring Wells	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	139	
5.1	18-Jan-96	Press Release, Environmental Testing of Ray Deaton Lake	Memphis and Shelby County Health Department	143	
5.1	1-Feb-98	Press Release, Public Invited to Depot Community Information Session	The Memphis Depot	284	
5.1	1-Jul-98	Press Release, Public Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Jul 98	The Memphis Depot	325	
5.1	1-Sep-98	Press Release, Public Invited to Depot Community Information Session	The Memphis Depot	349	
5.1	1-Sep-98	Press Release, Public Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 Sep 98	The Memphis Depot	350	
5.1	17-Sep-98	Press Release, Public Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 Sep 98	The Memphis Depot	360	
5.1	5-Oct-98	Press Release, Public Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Oct 98	The Memphis Depot	368	
5.1	1-Jun-99	Press Release, Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting Concerning Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal at Dunn Field, 17 Jun 99	The Memphis Depot	387	
5.1	16-Jun-99	Press Release, Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting at Memphis Depot	The Memphis Depot	395	
5.1	24-Feb-00	Press Release, Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal Project Set to Begin, Dunn Field	Defense Distribution Region Central	455	
5.1	7-Apr-00	Press Release, Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal Set to Begin, Dunn Field	Defense Distribution Region Central	497	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.1	26-Apr-00	Press Release, Public Notice of Upcoming Chemical Warfare Materiel Informational Meetings and RAB Meeting, 18 May 00	The Memphis Depot	500	
5.1	18-May-00	Press Release, Public Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 May 00	The Memphis Depot	462	
5.1	9-Jun-00	Press Release, Main Installation RI Results, Depot Reaches Milestone in Environmental Cleanup Program	Defense Distribution Region Central	436	
5.1	31-Jul-00	Press Release, Public Invited to Comment on Proposed Cleanup Alternatives, No 11-00	Defense Distribution Center	590	
5.1	22-Sep-00	Press Release, Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal Action Continues at Dunn Field, No 16-00	Defense Distribution Center	601	
5.1	17-May-01	Press Release, Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal Action Completed, No 3-01	Defense Distribution Center	622	
5.1	31-May-01	Press Release, Public Comment Period for Memphis Depot Property now available for Transfer to the City, DDC 5-01	Defense Distribution Center	1230	
5.1	4-Oct-01	Press Release, Soil Vapor Extraction Pilot Test: Cleanup Alternative to be Tested on Dunn Field, DDC 12-01	Defense Distribution Center	1231	
5.1	8-Oct-01	Press Release, Main Installation Record of Decision Completed Environmental Cleanup Decisions Approved for Memphis Depot, DDC 13-01	Defense Distribution Center	1232	
5.1	16-Jul-02	Press Release, Groundwater Monitoring Wells to be Installed in the Memphis Depot Community This Summer, DDC 05-02	Defense Distribution Center	1233	
5.1	16-Jul-02	Press Release, Memphis Depot Announces 30-day Public Comment Period for Surface Soil Removal Project at Dunn Field, DDC 04-02	Defense Distribution Center	1234	
5.1	13-Jan-03	Press Release, Soil Removal Begins at Former Pistol Range on Dunn Field	Defense Distribution Center	723	
5.1	1-May-03	Press Release, Dunn Field cleanup plans announced: Public invited to comment on proposed cleanup alternative in May, DDC 5-03	Defense Distribution Center	1235	
5.1	8-Sep-03	Press Release, Pre-Design Investigation of Disposal Sites Begins at Dunn Field, DDC 11-03	Defense Distribution Center	1236	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.1	19-May-04	Press Release, Record of Decision Signed Addressing Environmental Conditions at Memphis Depot's Dunn Field, DDC 10-04	Defense Distribution Center	1237	
5.1	2-Aug-04	Press Release, Dunn Field cleanup remedy moves forward: Groundwater monitoring expanded in Depot community, DDC 20-04	Defense Distribution Center	1238	
5.1	23-Mar-05	Press Release, Soil cleanup begins at Dunn Field, DDC 09-05	Defense Distribution Center	1239	
5.1	13-Mar-06	Press Release Field work continues on Dunn Field Additional	Defense Distribution Center	1240	
5.1	14-Dec-07	Press Release, Metal casings found at the former Memphis Depot environmental cleanup site, DDC 19-07	Defense Distribution Center	1241	
5.1	15-Dec-07	Press Release, Site cleared by Army ordnance specialists team at the former Memphis Depot environmental cleanup site, DDC 20-07	Defense Distribution Center	1242	
5.1	1-Oct-08	Press Release, Public Notice of Comment Period and Public Meeting, Proposed Cleanup Plan, Dunn Field	Defense Distribution Center	955	
5.1	13-Apr-09	Press Release, Dunn Field Record of Decision Amendment Approved for the Former Memphis Depot	Defense Distribution Center	985	
5.2		Advertisements			
5.2	6-Apr-94	Advertisement, "You Can Make a Difference; Become a Citizen Reviewer for The Memphis Depot"	The Commercial Appeal	59	
5.2	20-Nov-94	Advertisement, "Public Notice and Request for Public Comment - Federal Facilities Agreement	The Commercial Appeal	1243	
5.2	26-Nov-94	Advertisement, "Public Notice and Request for Public Comment - Federal Facilities Agreement	Tri-State Defender	1244	
5.2	1-Dec-94	Advertisement, "Public Notice and Request for Public Comment - Federal Facilities Agreement	Silver Star News	1245	
5.2	11-Dec-94	Advertisement, "Public Meeting and Comment Period, Federal Facilities Agreement"	The Commercial Appeal	90	
5.2	11-Mar-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Mar 98"	The Commercial Appeal	294	
5.2	12-Mar-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Mar 98"	The Memphis Flyer	459	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	18-Mar-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Mar 98"	The Memphis Flyer	295	
5.2	16-Apr-98	Advertisement, "The RAB Meeting for 16 Apr 98 Has Been Rescheduled"	The Memphis Flyer	306	
5.2	1-May-98	Advertisement, "Public Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 May 98"	The Memphis Flyer	311	
5.2	24-Jun-98	Advertisement, "Public Review and Comment on Findings of Suitability to Lease (FOSL 4, 5 and 6) and Notice of Availability of FOSL 3"	Silver Star News	1246	
5.2	25-Jun-98	Advertisement, "Public Review and Comment on Findings of Suitability to Lease (FOSL 4, 5 and 6) and Notice of Availability of FOSL 3"	The Commercial Appeal	1247	
5.2	8-Jul-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Jul 98"	The Commercial Appeal	333	
5.2	11-Jul-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Jul 98"	The Tri-State Defender	334	
5.2	12-Aug-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Aug 98"	The Silver Star News	340	
5.2	12-Aug-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Aug 98"	The Commercial Appeal	341	
5.2	15-Aug-98	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Aug 98"	The Tri-State Defender	342	
5.2	9-Sep-98	Advertisement, "RAB Meeting and Community Information Session"	The Commercial Appeal	356	
5.2	14-Jan-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Jan 99"	The Commercial Appeal	401	
5.2	10-Feb-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Feb 99"	Silver Star News	1248	
5.2	13-Feb-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Feb 99"	The Tri-State Defender	402	
5.2	11-Mar-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Mar 99"	The Commercial Appeal	403	
5.2	10-Apr-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Apr 99"	The Tri-State Defender	404	
5.2	11-May-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting Re: Cleanup of Old Paint Shop and Maintenance Area, 20 May 99"	Silver Star News	1249	
5.2	13-May-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting for EE/CA, 20 May 99"	The Commercial Appeal	405	
5.2	10-Jun-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting Re: Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal, 17 Jun 99"	The Commercial Appeal	1250	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	12-Jun-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting, 17 Jun 99"	The Tri-State Defender	406	
5.2	23-Jun-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period for EE/CA"	The Commercial Appeal	515	
5.2	26-Jun-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period"	The Tri-State Defender	396	
5.2	8-Jul-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jul 99"	The Commercial Appeal	397	
5.2	10-Jul-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jul 99"	The Tri-State Defender	514	
5.2	24-Jul-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period for EE/CA"	The Tri-State Defender	398	
5.2	27-Jul-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Pubic Comment Period for Chemical Warfare Materiel Removal and Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Aug 99"	The Commercial Appeal	1251	
5.2	27-Jul-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Aug 99"	The Commercial Appeal	513	
5.2	31-Aug-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Restoration Advisory Board Vacant Position as Citizen Representative"	Silver Star News	1252	
5.2	1-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Vacant Position as Citizen Representative"	Silver Star News	1377	
5.2	2-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Restoration Advisory Board Vacant Position as Citizen Representative"	The Commercial Appeal, DeSoto Neighbors	1253	
5.2	2-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Restoration Advisory Board Vacant Position as Citizen Representative"	The Commercial Appeal	1254	
5.2	4-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of Restoration Advisory Board Vacant Position as Citizen Representative"	Tri-State Defender	1255	
5.2	7-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Sep 99"	The Commercial Appeal	1256	
5.2	8-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Sep 99"	Silver Star News	1257	
5.2	11-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Sep 99"	Tri-State Defender	1258	
5.2	18-Sep-99	Advertisement, "Public Review and Comment on Findings of Suitability to Lease (FOSL 8)"	Tri-State Defender	1259	_
5.2	16-Oct-99	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Oct 99"	Tri-State Defender	1260	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	8-Dec-99	Advertisement, "Public Review and Comment on Findings of Suitability to Transfer"	Silver Star News	1261	
5.2	11-Dec-99	Advertisement, "Public Review and Comment on Findings of Suitability to Transfer"	Tri-State Defender	1262	
5.2	12-Jan-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jan 00"	Silver Star News	1263	
5.2	13-Jan-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jan 00"	The Commercial Appeal	407	
5.2	15-Jan-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jan 00"	The Tri-State Defender	484	
5.2	5-Feb-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 Feb 00"	The Tri-State Defender	408	
5.2	10-Feb-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 Feb 00"	The Commercial Appeal	435	
5.2	17-Feb-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meetings, Multiple Days"	The Commercial Appeal	417	
5.2	8-Mar-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Mar 00, and Community Information Session, 18 Mar 00"	Silver Star News	1264	
5.2	9-Mar-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting 16 Mar 00 and Community Information Session 18 Mar 00"	The Commercial Appeal	1265	
5.2	11-Mar-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Mar 00, and Community Information Session, 18 Mar 00"	The Tri-State Defender	409	
5.2	15-Mar-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Mar 00, and Community Information Session, 18 Mar 00"	Silver Star News	1266	
5.2	18-Mar-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Mar 00, and Community Information Session, 18 Mar 00"	Tri-State Defender	1267	
5.2	1-Apr-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 12, 19, and 26 Apr 00, and RAB Meeting 20 Apr 00"	Tri-State Defender	1268	
5.2	1-Apr-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Apr 00, and Weekly Chemical Warfare Materiel Briefings"	The Tri-State Defender	410	
5.2	6-Apr-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 12, 19, and 26 Apr 00"	The Commercial Appeal	439	
5.2	8-Apr-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 12, 19, and 26 Apr 00, and RAB Meeting 20 Apr 00"	Tri-State Defender	1269	
5.2	12-Apr-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Apr 00"	The Commercial Appeal	440	
5.2	12-Apr-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Apr 00"	The Silver Star News	454	·

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	15-Apr-00	,	The Tri-State Defender	443	
5.2	16-Apr-00	Advertisement, "RAB Meeting, 16 Apr 98 Has Been Rescheduled for 21 May 98"	The Memphis Flyer	400	
5.2	10-May-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 May 00"	Silver Star News	1378	
5.2	31-May-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jun 00"	Silver Star News	1270	
5.2	3-Jun-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jun 00"	Tri-State Defender	1271	
5.2	7-Jun-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jun 00"	The Commercial Appeal	1272	
5.2	7-Jun-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jun 00"	Silver Star News	1273	
5.2	10-Jun-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Jun 00"	Tri-State Defender	1274	
5.2	28-Jun-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 5, 12, 19 and 26 Jul 00"	The Commercial Appeal	1275	
5.2	1-Jul-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 5, 12, 19 and 26 Jul 00 and New Meeting Location"	Tri-State Defender	1276	
5.2	5-Jul-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 5 12, 19 and 26 Jul 00 and New Meeting Location"	Silver Star News	1277	
5.2	12-Jul-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jul 00"	The Commercial Appeal	1278	
5.2	15-Jul-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jul 00"	Tri-State Defender	1279	
5.2	29-Jul-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 2, 9, 16, 23, 30 Aug 00"	Tri-State Defender	1280	
5.2	1-Aug-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 2, 9, 16, 23, 30 Aug 00"	Silver Star News	1281	
5.2	9-Aug-00	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting, Proposed Cleanup Plan for the Main Installation, 24 Aug 00"	Silver Star News	1282	
5.2	12-Aug-00	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting, Proposed Cleanup Plan for the Main Installation, 24 Aug 00"	Tri-State Defender	1283	
5.2	12-Aug-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 6, 13, 20, 27 Sep 00"	Silver Star News	1284	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	2-Sep-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 6, 13, 20, 27 Sep 00"	Tri-State Defender	1285	
5.2	13-Sep-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Sep 00" and "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period, Main Installation Proposed Cleanup Plan"	The Commercial Appeal	1286	
5.2	13-Sep-00	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period, Main Installation Proposed Cleanup Plan"	Silver Star News	1287	
5.2	13-Sep-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Sep 00"	Silver Star News	1288	
5.2	16-Sep-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Sep 00" and "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period, Main Installation Proposed Cleanup Plan"	Tri-State Defender	1289	
5.2	11-Oct-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Oct 00"	The Commercial Appeal	1290	
5.2	11-Oct-00	Advertisement, "Position Available on the Memphis Depot Restoration Advisory Board (RAB)"	The Commercial Appeal	1291	
5.2	11-Oct-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Oct 00" and "Position Available on the Memphis Depot Restoration Advisory Board (RAB)"	Silver Star News	1292	
5.2	14-Oct-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Oct 00" and "Position Available on the Memphis Depot Restoration Advisory Board (RAB)"	Tri-State Defender	1293	
5.2	25-Oct-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 1, 8, 15, 29 Nov 00"	Silver Star News	1294	
5.2	28-Oct-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 1, 8, 15, 29 Nov 00"	Tri-State Defender	1295	
5.2	29-Nov-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 6, 13, 20 Dec 00"	The Commercial Appeal	1296	
5.2	2-Dec-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 6, 13, 20 Dec 00"	Tri-State Defender	1297	
5.2	6-Dec-00	Advertisement, "Intent to Amend Finding of Suitability to Transfer"	Silver Star News	1298	
5.2	9-Dec-00	Advertisement, "Intent to Amend Finding of Suitability to Transfer"	Tri-State Defender	1299	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	27-Dec-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 3, 10, 17, 24, 31 Jan 01"	The Commercial Appeal	1300	
5.2	27-Dec-00	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Jan 01"	Silver Star News	1324	
5.2	30-Dec-00	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 3, 10, 17, 24, 31 Jan 01"	Tri-State Defender	1301	
5.2	3-Jan-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Jan 01"	The Commercial Appeal	1302	
5.2	1-Feb-01	Advertisement, "Record of Decision Approved for the Main Installation"	The Commercial Appeal	682	
5.2	3-Feb-01	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 7, 14, 21, 28 Feb 01"	Tri-State Defender	1303	
5.2	28-Feb-01	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 7, 14, 21, 28 Mar 01"	The Commercial Appeal	1304	
5.2	28-Feb-01	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 7, 14, 21, 28 Mar 01"	Silver Star News	1305	
5.2	3-Mar-01	Advertisement, "Chemical Warfare Materiel Weekly Briefings, 7, 14, 21, 28 Mar 01"	Tri-State Defender	1306	
5.2	7-Mar-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Mar 01"	The Commercial Appeal	1307	
5.2	7-Mar-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Mar 01"	Silver Star News	1308	
5.2	10-Mar-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Mar 01"	Tri-State Defender	1309	
5.2	9-May-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 May 01"	The Commercial Appeal	1310	
5.2	9-May-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 May 01"	Silver Star News	1311	
5.2	12-May-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 17 May 01"	Tri-State Defender	1312	
5.2	1-Jun-01	Advertisement, "Public Notice of Finding of Suitability to Transfer"	The Commercial Appeal	1313	
5.2	9-Jun-01	Advertisement, "Public Notice of Finding of Suitability to Transfer"	Tri-State Defender	1314	
5.2	4-Jul-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jul 01"	Silver Star News	1315	
5.2	11-Jul-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jul 01"	The Commercial Appeal	1316	
5.2	11-Jul-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jul 01"	Silver Star News	1317	
5.2	14-Jul-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jul 01"	Tri-State Defender	1318	
5.2	8-Aug-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Aug 01"	Silver Star News	1319	
5.2	11-Aug-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Aug 01"	Tri-State Defender	1320	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	10-Oct-01	Advertisement, "Record of Decision Approved for Main Installation"	The Commercial Appeal	1321	
5.2	11-Oct-01	Advertisement, "Record of Decision Approved for Main Installation"	Silver Star News	1322	
5.2	10-Nov-01	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 15 Nov 01"	Tri-State Defender	1323	
5.2	13-Feb-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Feb 02"	Silver Star News	1325	
5.2	13-Feb-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Feb 02"	The Commercial Appeal	685	
5.2	16-Feb-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 21 Feb 02"	Tri-State Defender	1326	
5.2	10-Apr-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Apr 02"	Silver Star News	1327	
5.2	10-Apr-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Apr 02"	The Commercial Appeal	689	
5.2	12-Jun-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jun 02"	The Commercial Appeal	1328	
5.2	15-Jun-02	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Jun 02"	Tri-State Defender	697	
5.2	24-Jul-02	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period, 25 Jul-23 Aug 02 and Public Comment Meeting, 15 Aug 02, for Removal of Surface Soil	The Commercial Appeal	1329	
		Containing Lead at Former Pistol Range, Dunn Field"			
5.2	27-Jul-02	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period, 25 Jul-23 Aug 02 and Public Meeting, 15 Aug 02"	Tri-State Defender	706	
5.2	10-Oct-02	Advertisement, "RAB Meeting, 17 Oct 02"	The Commercial Appeal	1330	
5.2	12-Oct-02	Advertisement, "RAB Meeting, 17 Oct 02"	Tri-State Defender	714	
5.2	16-Oct-02	Advertisement, "RAB Meeting, 17 Oct 02"	Silver Star News	1331	
5.2	12-Feb-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Feb 03"	The Commercial Appeal	726	
5.2	15-Feb-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Feb 03"	Tri-State Defender	727	
5.2	7-May-03	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting, The Memphis Depot Proposed Cleanup Plan for Dunn Field"	Silver Star News	1332	
5.2	7-May-03	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting, The Memphis Depot Proposed Cleanup Plan for Dunn Field"	The Commercial Appeal	731	
5.2	10-May-03	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period and Public Meeting, The Memphis Depot Proposed Cleanup Plan for Dunn Field"	Tri-State Defender	1333	
5.2	11-Jun-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jun 03"	Silver Star News	1334	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	14-Jun-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jun 03"	Tri-State Defender	1335	
5.2	18-Jun-03	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period, The Memphis Depot Proposed Cleanup Plan for Dunn Field"	Silver Star News	1336	
5.2	18-Jun-03	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period, The Memphis Depot Proposed Cleanup Plan for Dunn Field"	The Commercial Appeal	740	
5.2	19-Jun-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Jun 03"	Tri-State Defender	741	
5.2	21-Jun-03	Advertisement, "Notice of Extension of Public Comment Period, The Memphis Depot Proposed Cleanup Plan for Dunn Field"	Tri-State Defender	1337	
5.2	8-Oct-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Oct 03"	Silver Star News	1338	
5.2	8-Oct-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Oct 03"	The Commercial Appeal	761	
5.2	11-Oct-03	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 16 Oct 03"	Tri-State Defender	1339	
5.2	10-Mar-04	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Mar 2004"	The Commercial Appeal	1340	
5.2	11-Mar-04	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Mar 2004"	Silver Star News	1341	
5.2	13-Mar-04	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 18 Mar 2004"	Tri-State Defender	1342	
5.2	24-Mar-04	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 3)"	The Commercial Appeal	1343	
5.2	25-Mar-04	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 3)"	Silver Star News	1344	
5.2	27-Mar-04	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 3)"	Tri-State Defender	1345	
5.2	26-May-04	Advertisement, "Record of Decision Approved for Dunn Field"	The Commercial Appeal	1346	
5.2	27-May-04	Advertisement, "Record of Decision Approved for Dunn Field"	Silver Star News	1347	
5.2	13-Aug-04	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Hearing, Intent to Reissue a Corrective Action Permit"	The Commercial Appeal	1348	
5.2	18-Aug-04	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Hearing, Intent to Reissue a Corrective Action Permit"	Silver Star News	1349	
5.2	21-Aug-04	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Hearing, Intent to Reissue a Corrective Action Permit"	Tri-State Defender	1350	
5.2	13-Oct-04	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting and Public Briefing, 21 Oct 04"	The Commercial Appeal	1351	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	14-Oct-04	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting and Public Briefing, 21 Oct 04"	Silver Star News	1352	
5.2	16-Oct-04	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting and Public Briefing, 21 Oct 04"	Tri-State Defender	1353	
5.2	12-Jan-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 20 Jan 2005"	Silver Star News	1354	
5.2	12-Jan-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 20 Jan 2005"	The Commercial Appeal	1355	
5.2	24-Jan-05	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 4)"	The Commercial Appeal	1356	
5.2	26-Jan-05	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 4)"	Silver Star News	1357	
5.2	29-Jan-05	Advertisement, "Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 4)"	Tri-State Defender	1358	
5.2	1-Feb-05	Advertisement, "Notice of Final Decision to Deny a Hazardous Waste Corrective Action Permit under the Tennessee Hazardous Waste Management Act"	The Commercial Appeal	1359	
5.2	2-Feb-05	Advertisement, "Notice of Final Decision to Deny a Hazardous Waste Corrective Action Permit under the Tennessee Hazardous Waste Management Act"	Silver Star News	1360	
5.2	5-Feb-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Community Information Session, 24 Feb 05"	Tri-State Defender	1361	
5.2	17-Feb-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Community Information Session, 24 Feb 05"	Silver Star News	1362	
5.2	11-May-05	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 May 05"	The Commercial Appeal	1363	
5.2	14-May-05	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 May 05"	Tri-State Defender	1364	
5.2	13-Jul-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 21 Jul 05, Remedial Design for Groundwater at the Main Installation"	The Commercial Appeal	1365	
5.2	13-Jul-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 21 Jul 05, Remedial Design for Groundwater at the Main Installation"	Silver Star News	1366	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.2	16-Jul-05	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 21 Jul 05, Remedial Design for Groundwater at the Main Installation"	Tri-State Defender	1367	
5.2	12-Oct-05	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Oct 05"	Silver Star News	1368	
5.2	15-Oct-05	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Oct 05"	Tri-State Defender	1369	
5.2	8-Apr-06	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Apr 06"	Tri-State Defender	1370	
5.2	19-Apr-06	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 20 Apr 06"	Silver Star News	1371	
5.2	7-Apr-07	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Apr 07"	Silver Star News	1372	
5.2	12-Apr-07	Advertisement, "Notice of RAB Meeting, 19 Apr 07"	Memphis Flyer	1373	
5.2	25-Apr-07	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 10 May 07, Remedial Design for Groundwater at Dunn Field"	Silver Star News	1374	
5.2	26-Apr-07	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 10 May 07, Remedial Design for Groundwater at Dunn Field"	Tri-State Defender	1376	
5.2	3-May-07	Advertisement, "The Former Memphis Depot Public Briefing, 10 May 07, Remedial Design for Groundwater at Dunn Field"	Memphis Flyer	1375	
5.2	7-Feb-10	Public Notice, Restoration Advisory Board adjournment	The Memphis Depot	1018	
5.2	14-Mar-10	Advertisement, Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 5)	The Memphis Depot	1025	
5.2	30-May-10	Advertisement, Notice of Public Comment Period for the Former Memphis Depot Finding of Suitability to Transfer (FOST 6)	The Memphis Depot	1042	
5.2	11-Apr-12	Advertisement, Public Comment Period for the Third Five-Year Review	Commercial Appeal	1068	
5.2	6-Feb-13	Advertisement, The Former Memphis Depot Final Five-Year Review Community Notification	Commercial Appeal	1098	
5.2	15-Mar-17	Advertisement, Notification of Five-Year Review	Commercial Appeal	1189	•
5.2	25-Apr-18	Advertisement, Notification of Signed Five-Year Review	Commercial Appeal	1208	
5.2	12-Mar-22	Advertisement, "Five Year Review Community Notification"	The Commercial Appeal	1546	
5.2	14-Jun-23	Advertisement, "Five Year Review Community Notification"	Commercial Appeal	1586	
5.3		Newspaper Articles			
5.3	14-Jul-46	Newspaper Article, "Nazi War Gas Seeps into Amory District"	The Commercial Appeal	426	
5.3	15-Jul-46	Newspaper Article, "Nazi Gas Bomb Leaks, Burns Eight at Amory"	The Press-Scimitar	427	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.3	15-Jul-46	Newspaper Article, "German Gas Escapes Here"	The Press-Scimitar	428	
5.3	16-Jul-46	Newspaper Article, "Bomb Squads at Work on Gas Leaks: Nine Casualties"	The Press-Scimitar	429	
5.3	16-Jul-46	Newspaper Article, "German Gas Claims Two More Casualties"	The Commercial Appeal	431	
5.3	17-Jul-46	Newspaper Article, "Gas Crew Still Busy"	The Press-Scimitar	430	
5.3	5-Feb-89	Newspaper Article, "Defense Depot Will be Tested for Toxic Waste"	The Commercial Appeal	10	
5.3	25-Feb-89	Newspaper Article, "Depot Wells"	The Commercial Appeal	434	
5.3	5-Mar-89	Newspaper Article, "Profile of Toxic Wastes Arising From New Data"	The Commercial Appeal	11	
5.3	6-Mar-89	Newspaper Article, "Testing Continues at Defense Depot"	The Daily News	12	
5.3	14-Mar-89	Newspaper Article, "Hazardous Material Moved"	The Commercial Appeal	437	
5.3	30-Oct-89	Newspaper Article, "Depot to Get New Water, Soil Tests"	UNK	14	
5.3	8-Apr-91	Newspaper Article, "Toxic Seep Heightens Risk Level to City Water"	The Commercial Appeal	20	
5.3	1-Mar-92	Newspaper Article, "Soil Toxins at Depot Could Taint City Water"	The Commercial Appeal	23	
5.3	6-Mar-92	Newspaper Article, "Corps to Treat Depot's Polluted Groundwater"	The Commercial Appeal	24	
5.3	15-Oct-92	Newspaper Article, "Depot, Landfill Added to Waste Cleanup List"	The Commercial Appeal	28	
5.3	3-Jun-93	Newspaper Article, "Burial Grounds, Anxiety Rises Over Toxic Contamination at the Defense Depot"	The Memphis Flyer	441	
5.3	20-Jun-94	Newspaper Article, "Officials Unearth Answers to Base Waste"	The Commercial Appeal	453	
5.3	19-Dec-94	Newspaper Article, "Cleanup Plans Target Underground Chemical Seepage"	The Commercial Appeal	92	
5.3	9-Jan-96	Newspaper Article, "Depot's Soil Tested Again for Pollution"	The Commercial Appeal	140	
5.3	29-Mar-96	Newspaper Article, "Neighbors of Depot Push for Answers"	The Commercial Appeal	432	
5.3	19-Mar-98	Newspaper Article, "Survey Targets Concerns of Depot Neighbors"	The Commercial Appeal	300	
5.3	1-Apr-98	Journal Article, "NACCHO Seeks to Facilitate Community Collaboration"	NACCO News	302	
5.3	12-Apr-98	Newspaper Article, "Military Residue From Past is Concern for Today"	The Commercial Appeal	304	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.3	1-Jul-98	Newspaper Article, Spotlighting on the Defense Depot Memphis RAB	The Neighbor News	463	
5.3	2-Dec-98	Newspaper Article, "The Agitators"	The Memphis Flyer	470	
5.3	10-Dec-98	Newspaper Article, "Depot Clarification"	The Memphis Flyer	469	
5.3	17-Dec-98	Newspaper Article, "Army Wants to Monitor TCE"	The Memphis Flyer	411	
5.3	15-Feb-99	Newspaper Article, "WWII Mustard Gas Pit to be Dug Up"	The Commercial Appeal	472	
5.3	21-Feb-99	Newspaper Article, "Memphis Takes on Military Depot"	The Philadelphia Inquirer	473	
5.3	24-Mar-99	Newspaper Article, "Memphis Depot Environmental Cleanup Contract"	The Silver Star News	476	
5.3	25-Mar-99	Newspaper Article, "Local Groups Intend to Apply for EPA Grant"	The Commercial Appeal	421	
5.3	25-Mar-99	Newspaper Article, "Memphis Depot Environmental Cleanup Contract"	The Commercial Appeal	475	
5.3	17-Jun-99	Newspaper Article, "Residents to be Told of Depot Work"	The Commercial Appeal	422	
5.3	18-Jun-99	Newspaper Article, "WWII Chemical Agents Will be Removed from Depot"	The Commercial Appeal	420	
5.3	18-Jun-99	Newspaper Article, "Depot Building to be Demolished"	The Commercial Appeal	516	
5.3	22-Jun-99	Newspaper Article, "Demolition at Defense Depot Paves the Way for Road Construction"	The Commercial Appeal	517	
5.3	1-Oct-99	Newspaper Article, "Group says minorities victims of pollution"	The Commercial Appeal	1379	
5.3	9-Jan-00	Newspaper Article, "Neighbors Worry Over Depot Drain-Off"	The Commercial Appeal	419	
5.3	24-Feb-00	Newspaper Article, "Defense Depot Pollution is Topic"	The Commercial Appeal	418	
5.3	15-Mar-00	Newspaper Article, "Depot Tent to Contain Toxic Cleanup"	The Commercial Appeal	416	
5.3	22-Mar-00	Newspaper Article, "Chemical Warfare Removal Project to Begin at Dunn Field"	The Silver Star News	415	
5.3	1-Apr-00	Newspaper Article, "Why is Everyone Ignoring Depot Cancer Victims?"	The Tri-State Defender	414	
5.3	4-Apr-00	Newspaper Article, "National Group Ends Race Protests"	The Commercial Appeal	413	
5.3	15-Apr-00	Newspaper Article, "Ford Continues HMO Fight; Plans Depot Meeting"	The Tri-State Defender	412	
5.3	19-Apr-00	Newspaper Article, "Delay Urged in Depot Cleanup"	The Commercial Appeal	399	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
5.3	28-Apr-00	Newspaper Article, "Chemical munitions clean-up at Depot to start in May"	Memphis Business Journal	1380	
5.3	23-May-00	Newspaper Article, "No Elevated Cancer Rate Found at Defense Depot"	The Commercial Appeal	504	
5.3	27-Sep-00	Newspaper Article, "Chemical Warfare Material Removal Action Continues at Dunn Field"	Silver Star News	1381	
5.3	14-Oct-00	Newspaper Article, "Mustard bomb site cleanup sickened workers"	The Commercial Appeal	1382	
5.3	18-May-01	Newspaper Article, "Chemical weapon excavation over at old Defense Depot"	The Commercial Appeal	1383	
5.3	16-Oct-01	Newspaper Article, "Depot waste faces 'vacuum'"	The Commercial Appeal	1384	
5.3	18-Oct-04	Newspaper Article, "Depot cleanup going deep"	The Commercial Appeal	1385	
5.3	12-May-05	Newspaper Article, "Toxic Concerns for Closed Bases"	Associated Press	1386	
5.3	7-Nov-07	Newspaper Article, "Business park in the works Dunn Field to be developed north of Memphis Depot site"	The Commercial Appeal	1387	
5.3	23-Aug-18	Newspaper Article, "Toxic Battles, The fight for Environmental Justice in Memphis"	Memphis Flyer	1388	
5.3	20-Apr-21	Newspaper Article, "Superfund contamination seeps into groundwater at breaches in Memphis Aquifer"	The Commercial Appeal	1523	
6		Newsletters/EnviroNews			
6	1-Sep-94	The Restoration Newsletter, Fall 94	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	76	
6	4-Apr-95	The Restoration Newsletter, Spring 95	The Memphis Depot	520	
6	1-Dec-95	The Restoration Newsletter, Winter 95	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	135	
6	1-Nov-96	The Restoration Newsletter, Fall 96	The Memphis Depot	526	
6	1-Jan-97	The Restoration Newsletter, Jan 97	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	202	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
6	1-May-97	The Restoration Newsletter, Mar-May 97	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	246	
6	1-Dec-97	EnviroNews, Nov-Dec 97	The Memphis Depot	269	
6	1-Feb-98	EnviroNews, Jan-Feb 98	The Memphis Depot	282	
6	1-May-98	EnviroNews, May 98	The Memphis Depot	310	
6	1-Jul-98	EnviroNews, Jul 98	The Memphis Depot	329	
6	1-Sep-98	EnviroNews, Sep 98	The Memphis Depot	1389	
6	1-Sep-98	EnviroNews, Sep 98	The Memphis Depot	355	
6	1-Nov-98	EnviroNews, Nov 98	The Memphis Depot	386	
6	1-Jan-99	EnviroNews, Jan-Feb 99	The Memphis Depot	372	
6	1-Mar-99	EnviroNews, Mar-Apr 99	The Memphis Depot	373	
6	1-May-99	EnviroNews, May-Jun 99	The Memphis Depot	374	
6	1-Jul-99	EnviroNews, Jul-Aug 99	The Memphis Depot	375	
6	1-Sep-99	EnviroNews, Sep-Oct 99	The Memphis Depot	480	
6	1-Nov-99	EnviroNews, Nov-Dec 99	The Memphis Depot	573	
6	1-Jan-00	EnviroNews, Jan-Feb 00	The Memphis Depot	483	
6	1-Mar-00	EnviroNews, Mar-Apr 00	The Memphis Depot	456	
6	1-May-00	EnviroNews, May-Jun 00	The Memphis Depot	501	
6	1-Jul-00	EnviroNews, Jul-Aug 00	The Memphis Depot	433	
6	1-Sep-00	EnviroNews, Sep-Oct 00	The Memphis Depot	594	
6	1-Nov-00	EnviroNews, Nov-Dec 00	The Memphis Depot	607	
6	1-Jan-01	EnviroNews, Jan-Feb 01	The Memphis Depot	610	
6	1-Mar-01	EnviroNews, Mar-Apr 01	The Memphis Depot	616	
6	1-May-01	EnviroNews, May/Jun 01	The Memphis Depot	621	
6	1-Jul-01	EnviroNews, Jul/Aug 01	The Memphis Depot	1390	
6	1-Oct-01	EnviroNews, Sep/Oct 01	The Memphis Depot	1391	
6	1-Apr-02	EnviroNews, Spring 02	The Memphis Depot	684	
6	1-Jul-02	EnviroNews, Summer 02	The Memphis Depot	693	
6	1-Mar-03	EnviroNews, Spring 03	The Memphis Depot	728	
6	1-Oct-03	EnviroNews, Fall 03	The Memphis Depot	759	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
6	1-Apr-04	EnviroNews, Spring 04	The Memphis Depot	1392	
6	1-Jul-04	EnviroNews, Summer 04	The Memphis Depot	1393	
6	1-Jul-05	EnviroNews, Summer 05	The Memphis Depot	1394	
6	1-Dec-05	EnviroNews, Winter 05	The Memphis Depot	1395	
6	1-Jul-06	EnviroNews, Summer 06	The Memphis Depot	1396	
6	1-Jan-07	EnviroNews, Winter 06/07	The Memphis Depot	1397	
6	1-Sep-07	EnviroNews, Summer 07	The Memphis Depot	908	
6	1-Jul-08	EnviroNews, Summer 08	The Memphis Depot	1398	
6	1-Dec-08	EnviroNews, Winter 08	The Memphis Depot	1399	
6	1-Jan-09	EnviroNews, Winter 09	The Memphis Depot	1400	
6	1-Jul-09	EnviroNews, Summer 09	The Memphis Depot	1401	
6	1-Jan-10	EnviroNews, Winter 09/10	The Memphis Depot	1402	
6	1-Jul-10	EnviroNews, Summer 10	The Memphis Depot	1403	
6	1-Jan-11	EnviroNews, Winter 10/11	The Memphis Depot	1404	
6	1-Jan-12	EnviroNews Winter 11/12 - Five Year Review Notification	The Memphis Depot	1076	
6	1-Jan-13	EnviroNews, Winter 12/13	The Memphis Depot	1405	
6	1-Jan-14	EnviroNews, Winter 13/14	The Memphis Depot	1406	
6	1-Jan-15	EnviroNews, Winter 14/15	The Memphis Depot	1407	
6	1-Jan-17	EnviroNews Winter 16/17 - Five-Year Review notification	The Memphis Depot	1183	
6	15-Dec-17	EnviroNews, Winter 17/18	The Memphis Depot	1467	
6	15-Dec-18	EnviroNews, Winter 18/19	The Memphis Depot	1468	
6	1-Dec-19	EnviroNews, Winter 2019	The Memphis Depot	1477	
6	1-Dec-20	EnviroNews, 2020	The Memphis Depot	1511	-
6	1-Dec-21	EnviroNews, 2021 - Five-Year Review Notification	The Memphis Depot	1539	-
6	1-Dec-22	EnviroNews, 2022	The Memphis Depot	1573	-
6	1-Dec-23	EnviroNews, 2023	HDR	1597	
6	1-Dec-24	EnviroNews, 2024	HDR	1626	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
7		Fact Sheets			
7.1		Fact Sheets			
7.1	1-Apr-92	Fact Sheet, Agency for Toxic Substances Disease Registry Public Health Assessments	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	25	
7.1	28-Jul-93	Fact Sheet, Agency for Toxic Substances Disease Registry Toxicological Profile Information Sheet	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	37	
7.1	1-Jun-94	Fact Sheet, Defense Depot Memphis	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	62	
7.1	1-Jul-94	Fact Sheet, Defense Distribution Depot Memphis Tennessee	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	65	
7.1	1-Dec-94	Fact Sheet, Interim Remedial Action	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	88	
7.1	1-Dec-94	Fact Sheet, Federal Facility Agreement	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	89	
7.1	1-Jan-95	Fact Sheet, Defense Logistics Agency Memphis	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	94	
7.1	25-Jan-95	Fact Sheet, Restoration Advisory Board Information Packet	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	99	
7.1	1-Oct-96	Fact Sheet, Agency for Toxic Substances Disease Registry	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	185	
7.1	1-Jan-97	Factsheet, Defense Department Unveils TAPP Program	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	203	
7.1	1-Oct-97	Fact Sheet, Public Health Assessment	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	262	
7.1	1-Jan-98	Fact Sheet, The Depot	The Memphis Depot	276	
7.1	1-Feb-98	Fact Sheet, Environmental, Depot	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	283	
7.1	16-Jun-98	Fact Sheet, The Depot, Identification of Test Kit Canisters, Dunn Field	Dorothy Richards The Memphis Depot	319	
7.1	1-Aug-98	Fact Sheet, Installation of Test Wells	The Memphis Depot	391	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
7.1	1-Sep-98	Fact Sheet, Working Toward a Safer Tomorrow, Cleanup of Recovered Chemical Warfare Materiel	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	352	
7.1	1-Sep-98	Fact Sheet, Environmental Restoration	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	353	
7.1	1-Sep-98	Fact Sheet, Environmental Engineering	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	354	
7.1	10-Sep-98	Fact Sheet, Groundwater Remediation System, Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	357	
7.1	24-Sep-98	Fact Sheet, Soil Removal, Family Housing Area	The Memphis Depot	362	
7.1	9-Nov-98	Fact Sheet, Groundwater Sampling Off-Site Near Depot	The Memphis Depot	392	
7.1	1-Dec-98	Fact Sheet, Groundwater Program	The Memphis Depot	393	
7.1	1-Dec-98	Fact Sheet, Asphalt Road Construction Begins, Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	394	
7.1	27-Jan-99	Fact Sheet, Neighborhood Notice of Groundwater Sampling	The Memphis Depot	390	
7.1	1-Feb-99	Fact Sheet, Working Toward a Safer Tomorrow	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	471	
7.1	5-Mar-99	Fact Sheet, Neighborhood Notice Concerning Sampling, Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	388	
7.1	5-Mar-99	Fact Sheet, Update Concerning Chemical Warfare Materiel, Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	389	
7.1	1-Jul-99	Fact Sheet, Memphis Depot Golf Course and Recreation Parcel	The Memphis Depot	518	
7.1	1-Mar-00	Fact Sheet, Maximum Credible Event	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	385	
7.1	1-Mar-00	Fact Sheet, Vapor Containment Structure	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	458	
7.1	1-Mar-00	Fact Sheet, Working Toward a Safer Tomorrow, Cleanup of Chemical Warfare Materiel	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	460	
7.1	1-Aug-00	Fact Sheet, Main Installation Proposed Plan Cleanup Alternatives	The Memphis Depot	1409	
7.1	1-Oct-00	Fact Sheet, Sampling Scheduled for Areas Near the Memphis Depot in October/November	The Memphis Depot	1410	
7.1	1-Jul-02	Fact Sheet, Sampling Scheduled for Areas Near the Memphis Depot in July/August	The Memphis Depot	1411	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
7.1	1-Jan-03	Fact Sheet, The Depot, Soil Removal Begins at Former Pistol Range on Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	722	
7.1	1-Jun-03	Fact Sheet, The Depot, Groundwater Sampling Scheduled for the Depot Community this Summer	The Memphis Depot	737	
7.1	1-Jun-03	Fact Sheet, The Depot, Pre-Design Investigation of Disposal Sites Begins at Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	748	
7.1	1-May-04	Fact Sheet, Excavation, Transport and Disposal	The Memphis Depot	1412	
7.1	1-May-04	Fact Sheet, Dunn Field Remedial Action Information	The Memphis Depot	1413	
7.1	1-May-04	Fact Sheet, Zero-Valent Iron (ZVI)	The Memphis Depot	1414	
7.1	1-Aug-04	Fact Sheet, Groundwater monitoring program expanded in Depot community	The Memphis Depot	1415	
7.1	1-Sep-04	Fact Sheet, Approved groundwater remedy to be implemented in community	The Memphis Depot	1416	
7.1	1-Nov-04	Fact Sheet, Additional wells for early cleanup action at former Depot	The Memphis Depot	1417	
7.1	1-Mar-06	Fact Sheet, Work begins on groundwater cleanup remedy at Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	1418	
7.1	1-Aug-07	Fact Sheet, Additional Groundwater Study for Cleanup Effort at Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	1419	
7.1	14-Dec-07	Fact Sheet, Excavations Reveal World War II Ordnance at Former Memphis Depot	The Memphis Depot	1420	
7.1	15-Dec-07	Fact Sheet, Excavated Metal Casings at Former Memphis Depot Found Harmless	The Memphis Depot	1421	
7.1	1-May-20	Factsheet, Additional Wells for Cleanup Effort at Former Depot	HDR	1516	
7.2		Letters to Residents - Fact Sheets			
7.2	12-Jul-93	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Notification of Public Exhibition and Discussion	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	444	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
7.2	8-Nov-93	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Monitoring Well Sampling	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	446	
7.2	2-Dec-93	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning First Study Conducted at Depot	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	450	
7.2	2-Dec-93	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Cancer Study Conducted at Depot Area	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	451	
7.2	13-Dec-94	Depot Memorandum Concerning Public Hearing for the Discussion of FFA	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	91	
7.2	28-Dec-95	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Groundwater Testing Project	Michael J. Kennedy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	136	
7.2	28-Dec-95	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Installation of Monitoring Wells in Neighborhoods	Michael J. Kennedy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	424	
7.2	28-Dec-95	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Testing Project for Groundwater Contamination	Michael J. Kennedy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	457	
7.2	28-Dec-95	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Installation of Wells Off-Base	Michael J. Kennedy, Col Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	519	
7.2	4-Jan-96	Depot Letter to Dunn Elementary School Concerning Installation of Groundwater Wells	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	522	
7.2	10-Oct-96	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Removal of Stockpiles, Site 62, Site 63, Site 64	Michael J. Kennedy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	423	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
7.2	8-Dec-97	Depot Letter to Residents Concerning Removal Activities, OU-1, Site 62, 63, 64	Glenn L. Kaden The Memphis Depot	530	
7.2	8-Dec-97	Depot Letter to Residents Concerning Notification of Groundwater Sampling	Glenn L. Kaden The Memphis Depot	531	
7.2	19-Sep-98	Depot Letter to Community Member Concerning Community Information Session	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	361	
7.2	25-Sep-98	Depot Letter to Residents Concerning Soil Removal at Depot's Family Housing Area	Alma Black Moore The Memphis Depot	468	
7.2	12-Apr-99	Depot Letter to Public Concerning Weekly Briefing for Removal Action of Chemical Warfare Materiel	Clyde Hunt The Memphis Depot	477	
7.2	25-Apr-00	Depot Letter to Resident Concerning Emergency Notification Sheet	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	461	
7.2	22-Mar-21	Letter to Glory Circle Property Owners (Redacted) Offsite Groundwater Investigation Results, Factsheet and Figure	James Foster, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1521	
7.2	15-Sep-21	Army Email to Adrienne Johnson, Economic Development Growth Engine of Memphis and Shelby County, Regarding Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) Request EPA-R4-2021-006023 and Attachment – Army Letter to EPA Regarding FOIA Request	Joan Hutton BRAC Environmental Coordinator, CALIBRE Systems	1535	
8		Restoration Advisory Board/Public Meetings/RAB Correspondence	ce		
8.1		Restoration Advisory Board (RAB)/Public Meetings			
8.1	24-Mar-93	Meeting Minutes, Questions and Answers From Mayor's Town Meeting, 24 May 93	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	35	
8.1	17-Feb-94	Technical Review Committee Meeting Minutes, 17 Feb 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	55	
8.1	21-Apr-94	Technical Review Committee Meeting Handout, 21 Apr 94	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	60	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	21-Apr-94	Technical Review Committee Meeting Minutes, 21 Apr 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	61	
8.1	23-Jun-94	Technical Review Committee Meeting Minutes, 23 Jun 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	64	
8.1	21-Jul-94	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Jul 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	70	
8.1	18-Aug-94	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Aug 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	71	
8.1	15-Sep-94	RAB Minutes, 15 Sep 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	78	
8.1	10-Nov-94	RAB Meeting Minutes, 10 Nov 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	85	
8.1	20-Nov-94	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Nov 94	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	86	
8.1	19-Jan-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Jan 95	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	98	
8.1	16-Feb-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Feb 95	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	101	
8.1	20-Apr-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Apr 95	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	107	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	18-May-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 May 95	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	112	
8.1	20-Jun-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Jun 95	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	116	
8.1	17-Aug-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Aug 95	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	120	
8.1	21-Sep-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Sep 95	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	130	
8.1	19-Oct-95	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 95	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	132	
8.1	18-Jan-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Jan 96	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	142	
8.1	15-Feb-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Feb 96	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	150	
8.1	21-Mar-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Mar 96	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	156	
8.1	18-Apr-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Apr 96	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	158	
8.1	16-May-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 May 96	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	161	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
			Christine E. Kartman		
8.1	20-Jun-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Jun 96	Defense Distribution Depot	165	
			Memphis TN		
0.4	40 1 100	DADA (ACLICO	Christine E. Kartman	400	
8.1	18-Jul-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Jul 96	Defense Distribution Depot	169	
			Memphis TN	165 169 176 183 184 188 198 204 210	
8.1	15 Aug 06	DAR Mosting Minutes, 15 Aug 06	Christine E. Kartman	176	
8.1	15-Aug-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Aug 96	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	176	
			PRC Environmental	169 176 183 184 188 198 204 210 226	
8.1	18-Sep-96	Defense Environmental Response Task Force Transcript, 18 Sep 96	Management, Inc.	183	
			Christine E. Kartman		
Ω 1	10 Sep 06	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Sep 96	Defense Distribution Depot	184	
0.1	8.1 19-Sep-96	ocp-50 Trad Miceting Minutes, 15 ocp 50	Memphis TN		
			Defense Distribution Depot		
8.1	17-Oct-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Oct 96	Memphis TN	188	
		Defense Environmental Response Task Force Transcript, 18 Sep 96,	PRC Environmental	1	
8.1	16-Dec-96	requested by DDMT	Management, Inc.	198	
			Glenn L. Kaden		
8.1	16-Jan-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Jan 97	Defense Distribution Depot	204	
			Memphis TN		
			Glenn L. Kaden		
8.1	20-Feb-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Feb 97	Defense Distribution Depot	210	
			Memphis TN		
			Glenn L. Kaden		
8.1	20-Mar-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Mar 97	Defense Distribution Depot	226	
			Memphis TN		
			Glenn L. Kaden		
8.1	17-Apr-97	17-Apr-97 RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Apr 97	Defense Distribution Depot	234	
			Memphis TN		

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	19-Jun-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Jun 97	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	252	
8.1	17-Jul-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Jul 97	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	254	
8.1	21-Aug-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Aug 97	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	257	
8.1	18-Sep-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Sep 97	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	260	
8.1	16-Oct-97	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Oct 97	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	265	
8.1	22-Jan-98	RAB Meeting Minutes and Presentation, 22 Jan 98	The Memphis Depot	1422	
8.1	22-Jan-98	RAB Agenda and Presentation Materials, 22 Jan 98	The Memphis Depot	279	
8.1	19-Feb-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Feb 98	Glenn L. Kaden The Memphis Depot	287	
8.1	19-Mar-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Mar 98	Glenn L. Kaden The Memphis Depot	298	
8.1	21-May-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 May 98	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	315	
8.1	18-Jun-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Jun 98	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	321	
8.1	26-Jun-98	Memphis Health Education and Promotions Subgroup Conference Call Minutes, 26 Jun 98	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	367	
8.1	16-Jul-98	RAB Charter	The Memphis Depot	336	
8.1	16-Jul-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Jul 98	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	337	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	20 Aug 00	DAR Mosting Minutes, 20 Aug 09	Shawn Phillips, PE	347	
0.1	20-Aug-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Aug 98	The Memphis Depot	347	
8.1	17-Sep-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Sep 98	Shawn Phillips, PE	359	
0.1	17-Sep-96	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Sep 96	The Memphis Depot	359	
8.1	15-Oct-98	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Oct 98	The Memphis Depot	535	
8.1	21-Jan-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Jan 99	The Memphis Depot	542	
8.1	18-Feb-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Feb 99	The Memphis Depot	543	
8.1	18-Feb-99	RAB Meeting Groundwater Update Presentation, 18 Feb 99	The Memphis Depot	544	
8.1	18-Mar-99	Update Pages, RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Jan 99	The Memphis Depot	547	
8.1	18-Mar-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Mar 99	The Memphis Depot	548	
8.1	15-Apr-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Apr 99	The Memphis Depot	549	
8.1	20-May-99	Public Comment Period Meeting Minutes, EE/CA	The Memphis Depot	554	
8.1	20-May-99	Soil Removal Action Presentation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	555	
8.1	17-Jun-99	Public Comments Period Meeting Minutes, EE/CA	The Memphis Depot	557	
8.1	17-Jun-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Jun 99	The Memphis Depot	558	
8.1	15-Jul-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Jul 99	The Memphis Depot	561	
8.1	19-Aug-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Aug 99	The Memphis Depot	566	
8.1	19-Aug-99	RAB Presentation for Reuse, 19 Aug 99	The Memphis Depot	567	
8.1	16-Sep-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Sep 99	The Memphis Depot	1423	
8.1	21-Oct-99	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Oct 99	The Memphis Depot	1424	
8.1	18-Jan-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Sep 00	The Memphis Depot	612	
8.1	20-Jan-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Jan 00	The Memphis Depot	485	
8.1	17-Feb-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Feb 00	The Memphis Depot	492	
8.1	16-Mar-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Mar 00	The Memphis Depot	494	
8.1	20-Apr-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Apr 00	The Memphis Depot	499	
8.1	17-May-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 May 00	The Memphis Depot	502	
8.1	15-Jun-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Jun 00	The Memphis Depot	505	_
8.1	20-Jul-00	RAB Meeting Presentation, RI, Baseline Risk Assessment, 20 Jul 00	The Memphis Depot	589	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	24-Aug-00	Public Comment Period Meeting Minutes, Proposed Plan, 24 Aug 00	The Memphis Depot	593	
8.1	21-Sep-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Jul 00	The Memphis Depot	591	
8.1	19-Oct-00	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 00	The Memphis Depot	606	
8.1	18-Jan-01	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Jan 01	The Memphis Depot	1425	
8.1	15-Feb-01	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Feb 01	The Memphis Depot	1426	
8.1	15-Mar-01	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Mar 01	The Memphis Depot	1427	
8.1	17-May-01	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 May 01	The Memphis Depot	1428	
8.1	19-Jul-01	RAB Meeting Presentation, Groundwater Update, 19 Jul 01	CH2M Hill, Inc.	629	
8.1	15-Nov-01	RAB Meeting Presentation, Groundwater Update, 15 Nov 01	CH2M Hill, Inc.	638	
8.1	15-Nov-01	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Jul 01	The Memphis Depot	639	
8.1	15-Nov-01	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Aug 01	The Memphis Depot	640	
8.1	15-Nov-01	RAB Meeting Presentation, Dunn Field RI Overview	CH2M Hill, Inc.	683	
8.1	21-Feb-02	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 Nov 01	The Memphis Depot	646	
8.1	21-Feb-02	RAB Meeting Minutes, 21 Feb 02	The Memphis Depot	686	
8.1	21-Feb-02	RAB Meeting Presentation, Memphis Depot Environmental Program Update	The Memphis Depot	687	
8.1	21-Feb-02	RAB Meeting Presentation, Memphis Depot, Dunn Field RI Summary of Findings	CH2M Hill, Inc.	688	
8.1	18-Apr-02	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Apr 02	The Memphis Depot	691	
8.1	30-May-02	RAB Training Class	Hess Environmental Services, Inc.	1429	
8.1	20-Jun-02	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Jun 02	The Memphis Depot	699	
8.1	15-Aug-02	Public Comment Meeting Minutes, Removal of Surface Soil Containing Lead at the Former Pistol Range, Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	1430	
8.1	17-Oct-02	RAB Meeting Minutes, 17 Oct 02	The Memphis Depot	715	
8.1	17-Oct-02	RAB Meeting Presentation, Memphis Depot Environmental Program Progress Report, 02	The Memphis Depot	716	
8.1	20-Feb-03	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Feb 03	The Memphis Depot	805	
8.1	15-May-03	RAB Meeting Minutes, 15 May 03	The Memphis Depot	735	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	19-Jun-03	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Jun 03	The Memphis Depot	749	
8.1	16-Oct-03	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Oct 03	The Memphis Depot	550	
8.1	18-Mar-04	RAB Meeting Minutes, 18 Mar 04	The Memphis Depot	1431	
8.1	20-Jan-05	Public Meeting Minutes Remedial Design for the Dunn Field Disposal Sites, 20 Jan 05	The Memphis Depot	874	
8.1	20-Jan-05	Public Meeting Presentation Remedial Design for the Dunn Field Disposal Sites	CH2M Hill, Inc.	875	
8.1	20-Oct-05	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Oct 05	The Memphis Depot	1432	
8.1	20-Apr-06	RAB Meeting Minutes and Presentation, 20 Apr 06	The Memphis Depot	1433	
8.1	19-Oct-06	RAB Meeting Presentation, 19 Oct 06	The Memphis Depot	1434	
8.1	19-Apr-07	RAB Meeting Minutes and Presentation, 19 Apr 07	The Memphis Depot	1435	
8.1	10-May-07	Public Briefing for Dunn Field Source Areas Remedial Design and Presentation, 10 May 07	The Memphis Depot	1436	
8.1	10-May-07	Public Briefing Meeting Minutes, Dunn Field Source Areas Remedial Design, 10 May 07	The Memphis Depot	896	
8.1	10-May-07	Public Meeting Presentation, Dunn Field Source Areas Remedial Design	CH2M Hill, Inc.	897	
8.1	20-Sep-07	RAB Meeting Minutes, Five-Year Review Notification, 20 Sep 07	The Memphis Depot	910	
8.1	20-Sep-07	RAB Presentation, Five-Year Review Notification	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	911	
8.1	3-Apr-08	RAB Meeting Minutes and Presentation, 3 Apr 08	The Memphis Depot	1437	
8.1	9-Oct-08	RAB Meeting Minutes and Presentation, 9 Oct 08	The Memphis Depot	1438	
8.1	13-Nov-08	Public Comment Meeting Presentation, Dunn Field Revised Proposed Plan, 13 Nov 08	Michael Dobbs The Memphis Depot	966	
8.1	13-Nov-08	Public Comment Meeting Transcript, Dunn Field Revised Proposed Plan	The Memphis Depot	967	
8.1	5-Feb-09	Public Briefing Presentation, Dunn Field Off Depot Groundwater Remedial Design, 5 Feb 09	CH2M Hill, Inc.	980	
8.1	5-Feb-09	Public Briefing Transcript Dunn Field Off Denot Groundwater Pemedial	The Memphis Depot	981	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
8.1	30-Sep-09	RAB Meeting Invitation Letter, Minutes and Presentation, 29 Oct 09	Michael Dobbs, Defense Distribution Center/The Memphis Depot	1439	
8.2		RAB Correspondence			
8.2	11-Jan-95	RAB Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on IRA	John L. Garrison, Jr RAB Member	97	
8.2	18-Oct-96	RAB Letter to USEPA Concerning Federal Register Publication of RAB Proposed Rule	John L. Garrison, Jr RAB Member	189	
8.2	12-Aug-99	Depot Letter to RAB Members Concerning Response to Meeting Questions, 15 Jul 99	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	564	
8.2	1-Sep-99	RAB Member Letter to Depot Concerning RAB Meeting Agenda, 16 Sep 99	Eugene Brayon H RAB Member	568	
8.2	5-Oct-99	Depot Letter to RAB Members Concerning Risk Assessment Guidance Training	Alma Black Moore The Memphis Depot	570	
8.2	1-May-00	RAB Members Letter to RAB Concerning RAB Meeting, 20 Apr 00	Ulysses Truitt RAB Member	584	
8.2	12-Jul-00	RAB Member Comments on RAB Meeting, 15 Jun 00	John L. Garrison, Jr RAB Member	587	
8.2	12-Jul-00	RAB Member Resignation Letter	John L. Garrison, Jr RAB Member	588	
8.2	26-Sep-00	RAB Members Letter to Depot Concerning Request for Information for RAB Member Conflict of Interest Issue	Kevin E. Clay RAB Member	602	
8.2	8-Jun-01	Depot Letter to RAB Member Concerning Information Repository	Michael Dobbs The Memphis Depot	649	
8.2	8-May-03	RAB Member Letter to Depot Concerning Kids and Chemical-Facts of Law	Eugene H. Brayon RAB Member	732	
8.2	18-Dec-09	DDC-DES-EE Letter to RAB members Regarding Adjournment Attachments: DLA Memo, 18 Dec 09; RAB minutes 29 Oct 09	Michael Dobbs, Defense Distribution Center	1011	
8.2	19-Jan-10	DDC Letter to RAB Regarding Invitation to RAB Adjournment Ceremony	Mike Dobbs Defense Distribution Command	1514	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9		Site Background/Site Management/Notice of Land Use Restriction	ons		
9.1		Site Background/Site Management			
9.1	26-Sep-85	TDHE Letter to Depot Concerning RA and Dioxin Contamination	Paul Patterson Tennessee Department of Health and Environment	4	
9.1	18-Jun-89	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning RI/FS Revised Final Work Plans	James H. Scarbrough Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	13	
9.1	1-Jan-90	Resource Conservation and Recovery Act (RCRA) Facilities Assessment Report	A T Kearney, Inc.	15	
9.1	19-Jul-90	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning RCRA Facilities Assessment Report Findings	James H. Scarbrough Tom Tiesler Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	16	
9.1	27-Nov-91	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Interim Remedial Measures Work Plan	James S. Kutzman Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	22	
9.1	22-Jul-92	TDEC Letter to USEPA Concerning Draft Final Interim Remedial Measures Work Plan	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	27	
9.1	1-Nov-92	Pump Test Technical Memorandum	Engineering-Science, Inc.	1445	
9.1	3-Mar-93	HQ DLA Letter to TDEC Concerning Federal Facility Agreement for DDRC	James M. Carr HQ Defense Logistics Agency-G	29	
9.1	23-Mar-93	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning NOTI of Draft RFI Work Plan	W.F. Murphy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	30	
9.1	1-Apr-93	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning NOTI of Draft RFI Work Plan	W.F. Murphy, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	31	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	15-Apr-93	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning FFA Negotiations	Margaret J. Krueger Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	32	
9.1	20-Apr-93	TDEC Letter to HQ DLA Concerning Proposed Clause in FFA	Joseph Sanders Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	33	
9.1	11-Jun-93	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning FFA and disestablishment of DDRC	Michael Rust, COL Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	36	
9.1	17-Aug-93	USACE Letter to Depot Concerning Role of Government Agencies in Site Restoration Program	John D. Matthews U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	39	
9.1	1-Oct-93	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Site Management Plan	Allison W. Drew Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	41	
9.1	12-Oct-93	DDRC Letter to TDEC Concerning Community Interviews, Ditch Flow Problems	Douglas S. Waters, Jr Defense Distribution Region Central	447	
9.1	27-Oct-93	TDEC Letter to DDRC Concerning Unknown Discharge Investigation	Lew E. Hoffman Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	448	
9.1	6-Dec-93	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of Extension Request for Revised Draft RFI Work Plans	Joseph R. Franzmathes Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	43	
9.1	26-Jan-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Federal Facilities Environmental Compliance Profiles	Arthur Linton Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	53	
9.1	9-Feb-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final CRP	Allison W. Drew Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	54	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	28-Mar-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning NOTI and Technical Review Comments for RI/FS Work Plan, QAPP, HSP, and FSP	Joseph R. Franzmathes Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	57	
9.1	31-Mar-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning NOTI for Interim Measures for Contaminated Groundwater, Dunn Field	Joseph R. Franzmathes Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	58	
9.1	3-Jun-94	High Resolution Seismic Reflection Survey to Image the Top and Bottom of a Shallow Clay Layer	Kansas Geological Survey/The University of Kansas	1446	
9.1	8-Jul-94	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final EA, Site Management Plan, and CRP	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	68	
9.1	12-Jul-94	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final Engineering Report, Removal Action for Groundwater	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	69	
9.1	1-Aug-94	RCRA Permit II, Spill Prevention, Control and Countermeasures Plan and Installation Spill Control Plan	The Memphis Depot	1447	
9.1	24-Aug-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Generic RI/FS Work Plan, QAPP, HSP, and FSP	Martha Berry Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	72	
9.1	24-Aug-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning NOTI for Draft RFI Work Plan	Joseph R. Franzmathes Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	73	
9.1	9-Sep-94	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	77	
9.1	20-Sep-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	Martha Berry Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	79	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	18-Oct-94	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	Frank Novitzki Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	80	
9.1	27-Oct-94	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	81	
9.1	27-Oct-94	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Revisions to Site Management Plan	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	83	
9.1	7-Nov-94	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	Martha Berry Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	84	
9.1	22-Dec-94	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Public Comment on Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	Frank Novitzki Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	93	
9.1	13-Mar-95	Federal Facilities Agreement	Johnston, Jon D Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	103	
9.1	12-Apr-95	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final Generic HSP	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	104	
9.1	13-Apr-95	ATSDR Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final Screening Sites FSP	Jeff Kellam Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	105	
9.1	19-Apr-95	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final FSP and Generic RI/FS Work Plan, OU-4	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	106	
9.1	28-Apr-95	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final Generic QAPP	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	108	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	5-May-95	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Review of Generic RI/FS Work Plan, QAPP, and FSPs	Martha Berry Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	110	
9.1	8-May-95	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Final Generic RI/FS Work Plan and Screening Sites FSP	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	111	
9.1	31-May-95	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Revisions to Site Management Plan	Frank Novitzki Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	113	
9.1	13-Jun-95	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning FSP, OU-1, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	115	
9.1	18-Jul-95	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Comments on Draft Final FSP	Frank Novitzki Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	117	
9.1	1-Aug-95	Responses to USEPA Comments on Draft ROD for IRA of Groundwater	CH2M Hill, Inc.	119	
9.1	6-Sep-95	AMCPM-NSM Letter to Distribution Concerning Draft Interim Holding Facility Plan	AMCPM-NSM	128	
9.1	8-Sep-95	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Draft Final ROD for IRA of Groundwater, OU-1	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	380	
9.1	19-Oct-95	THE PATATION TO HANDLE ONCOMING COMMAND ON HIGH RULL FOR IRA OF	Martha Berry Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	383	
9.1	1-Nov-95	Chemical Agent Identification Sets (CAIS) Information Package	U.S. Army Program Manager for Chemical Demilitarization	1408	
9.1	30-Nov-95	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Comments on Final FSPs, OU-1, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	Harold Roach Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	134	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	12-Jan-96	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Removal of Depot from Tennessee List of Inactive Hazardous Substance Sites	Clinton W. Willer Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	141	
9.1	18-Jan-96	SFIM Letter to SFAE Concerning Draft Final Interim Holding Facility Plan	Paul E. Wojciechowski, LTC SFIM-AEC-BCD	144	
9.1	25-Jan-96	Depot Letter to USAEC Concerning Draft Final Interim Holding Plan	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	147	
9.1	7-Feb-96	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Comments on ROD for Groundwater IRA	Harold Roach Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	149	
9.1	22-Feb-96	SFIM Letter to Depot Concerning Draft ROD for Groundwater IRA, OU-1	Paul E. Wojciechowski, LTC SFIM-AEC-BCD	152	
9.1	1-Mar-96	Response to Comments on Draft ROD for Groundwater IRA, OU-1	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	153	
9.1	18-Mar-96	SFAE Letter to Depot Concerning Interim Holding Facility Support Requirements	Robert E. Hilliard SFAE-CD-NM	154	
9.1	20-Mar-96	CH2M Hill Letter to USACE Concerning Response to TDEC Comments on Generic RI/FS Work Plan, QAPP, HSP, and Screening Sites FSP	Mark Corey CH2M Hill, Inc.	155	
9.1	28-Mar-96	Depot Letter to BCT Member Concerning IRA Design for Pump and Treat	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	525	
9.1	24-Apr-96	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning ROD for IRA of Groundwater, Dunn Field, OU-1	Clinton W. Willer Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	159	
9.1	1-May-96	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning ROD for IRA of Groundwater, OU-1	Richard D. Green Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	160	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	6-Jun-96	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Groundwater IRA	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	162	
9.1	7-Jun-96	Attorney Letter to USACE Concerning Right of Entry for Survey and Exploration	Ira Drayton Pruitt, Jr Pruitt, Pruitt and Watkins, P.A.	163	
9.1	12-Jun-96	Depot Letter to USACE Concerning Comments on Concept Design Submittal, Groundwater IRA	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	164	
9.1	20-Jun-96	Depot Letter to USACE Concerning 60% Concept Design for Groundwater IRA	Harold Roach Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	166	
9.1	1-Jul-96	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning 30% Completion for RD, OU-1	Dann J. Spariosu Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	167	
9.1	15-Jul-96	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Interim Holding Facility Support Requirements	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	168	
9.1	31-Jul-96	USACE Letter to Depot Concerning Installation Restoration Program	John D. Matthews U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	174	
9.1	7-Feb-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Baseline Risk Assessment for Golf Course Impoundments	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	206	
9.1	12-Feb-97	Depot Letter to TDEC Transmitting Revised Concept Design Submittal for Groundwater IRA	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	207	
9.1	12-Feb-97	Depot Letter to USEPA Transmitting Revised Concept Design Submittal for Groundwater IRA	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	208	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	12-Feb-97	Depot Letter to USEPA Transmitting Draft BRAC Sampling Program Report	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	209	
9.1	21-Feb-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Pre-Draft CRP	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	211	
9.1	21-Feb-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft BRAC Sampling Program	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	212	
9.1	24-Feb-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning 50% Design Analysis Report and Drawings for Groundwater IRA	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	213	
9.1	24-Feb-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Revised Concept Design Submittal for Groundwater IRA	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	214	
9.1	4-Mar-97	Depot Letter to Memphis Public Works Concerning Groundwater Contamination Concentrations	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	217	
9.1	10-Mar-97	Depot Letter to TDEC Transmitting Draft Groundwater Characterization Technical Memorandum	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	218	
9.1	10-Mar-97	Depot Letter to USEPA Transmitting Draft Groundwater Characterization Technical Memorandum	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	219	
9.1	12-Mar-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Letter and Summary Table for Groundwater Quality Data, Dunn Field	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	221	
9.1	12-Mar-97	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Risk Assessment for Golf Course Pond and Lake Danielson	Dann J. Spariosu Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	222	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	17-Mar-97	Depot Letter to TDEC Transmitting Waterways Experiment Station Draft Groundwater Modeling Report	Glenn L. Kaden The Memphis Depot	223	
9.1	19-Mar-97	Depot Letter to TDEC Transmitting Sampling and Analysis Recommendations	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	224	
9.1	19-Mar-97	Depot Letter to USEPA Transmitting Sampling and Analysis Recommendations	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	225	
9.1	25-Mar-97	Depot Letter to USGS Transmitting Groundwater Characterization Technical Memorandum	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	227	
9.1	1-Apr-97	Depot Letter to TDEC Transmitting Draft Background Sampling Program Technical Memorandum	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	228	
9.1	1-Apr-97	Depot Letter to USEPA Transmitting Draft Background Sampling Technical Memorandum	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	229	
9.1	7-Apr-97	USACE Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Baseline Risk Assessment for Golf Course Pond Impoundments	Michael H. Thompson U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District	230	
9.1	8-Apr-97	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Review of Groundwater Modeling Report, Dunn Field	Dann J. Spariosu Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	231	
9.1	15-Apr-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Groundwater Characterization Technical Memorandum and Groundwater Modeling Approach for Remediation Design	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	232	
9.1	16-Apr-97	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Response to Comments on Baseline Risk Assessment, Golf Course Impoundments	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	233	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	16-Apr-97	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Response to Comments on Baseline Risk Assessment, Golf Course Impoundments	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	328	
9.1	30-Apr-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Response to Comments on Draft Baseline Risk Assessment, Golf Course Impoundments	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	236	
9.1	30-Apr-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Groundwater IRA 50% Drawings and Specifications and Part III Design Calculations	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	243	
9.1	2-May-97	USACE Letter to TDEC Concerning Preliminary Investigation for Groundwater, OU-2	John D. Matthews U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	528	
9.1	22-May-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Background Sampling Program Technical Memorandum	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	248	
9.1	13-Jun-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Transmitting Results of TDSF Split Samples	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	251	
9.1	21-Jul-97	IProgram Lechnical Memorandum	Dann J. Spariosu Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	255	
9.1	9-Sep-97	CH2M Hill Letter to USACE Concerning Response to Comments on Background Characterization Technical Memorandum	Greg Underberg CH2M Hill, Inc.	259	
9.1	24-Sep-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Draft SAP for Fish and Sediment Sampling	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	261	
9.1	19-Nov-97	·	Robert V. Nore U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	267	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	2-Dec-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Transmitting Results of Split Samples	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	270	
9.1	8-Dec-97	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Draft Background Sampling Program Technical Memorandum	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	272	
9.1	20-Jan-98	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on EE/CA Site Characterization Draft Work Plan, OU-1	Torres, Ramon Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	278	
9.1	17-Feb-98	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Baseline Risk Assessment, HSP, SAP, and Draft Preliminary Risk Evaluation	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	285	
9.1	25-Feb-98	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Background Characterization Technical Memorandum	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	288	
9.1	9-Mar-98	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Baseline Risk Assessment, HSP, and SAP, Golf Course Impoundments	Terry R. Templeton Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	293	
9.1	16-Apr-98	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Response to Comments on Draft Baseline Risk Assessment, Golf Course Impoundments	The Memphis Depot	305	
9.1	10-Jun-98	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments and Approval of SAP for Contaminated Soil Remediation, Family Housing Area	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	534	
9.1	12-Jun-98	Depot Memorandum for Record Concerning Canisters Found During Groundwater IRA Construction, Dunn Field	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	318	
9.1	21-Jul-98	USACE MOA, UT Medical Group, Shelby County	John D. Matthews U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	339	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	10-Sep-98	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Review of Draft FSP Addenda for OU-2, OU-3, OU-4, and Screening Sites	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	466	
9.1	29-Sep-98	ESP Addends and Screening Sites OLL2 OLL3 OLL4	Shawn Phillips, PE Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	467	
9.1	1-Jun-99	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Final FS Addenda, Dunn Field, Main Installation (attachment found at AR #363, 364, 365, 366, 474)	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	512	
9.1	14-Jun-99	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Proposed Change to RI Schedule, Dunn Field	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	771	
9.1	21-Jun-99	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Soil Remediation Post Removal Report, Cafeteria Bldg, Site 73	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	559	
9.1	21-Jun-99	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Soil Remediation Post Removal Report, Family Housing Area, Site 73	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	560	
9.1	28-Jul-99	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Updated Schedule for RI Interim Milestones	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	772	
9.1	10-Jan-00	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Draft RI Report	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	576	
9.1	12-Jan-00	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Draft RA Safety Submission	Jordan English Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	577	
9.1	1-Jun-00	USEPA and TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on FS, Draft Soil Report, Main Installation	James W. Morrison, PG Turpin Ballard Tennessee Department of	508	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	1-Jun-00	USEPA and TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on FS, Draft Groundwater Report, Main Installation	James W. Morrison, PG Turpin Ballard Tennessee Department of	509	
9.1	30-Jun-00	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Soil and Groundwater FS, Main Installation (attachment found at AR #510, 511)	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	506	
9.1	30-Jun-00	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Soil and Groundwater FS, Main Installation (attach found at AR #510, 511)	Shawn Phillips, PE The Memphis Depot	507	
9.1	8-Sep-00	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of RI/FS and Proposed Plan	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	596	
9.1	12-Sep-00	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Proposed Plan	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	597	
9.1	13-Sep-00	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on FS for Groundwater, FS for Soil	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	598	
9.1	11-May-01	City Letter to CH2M Hill Concerning Approval of Request for Groundwater Disposal	Akil Al-Chokhachi City of Memphis	624	
9.1	16-May-01	USACE Letter to Depot Concerning SI and Removal Action Notice of Completion for Chemical Warfare Materiel	John C. Potter U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	625	
9.1	12-Jun-01	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of Pre-Design Data Collection	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	651	
9.1	10-Jul-01	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of Pre-Design Data Collection	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	653	
9.1	23-Aug-01	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Main Installation ROD for AR Incorporation	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	652	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	6-Sep-01	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Signing of ROD	Jon D. Johnston Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	633	
9.1	6-Sep-01	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning USEPA Signing of ROD	Richard D. Green Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	634	
9.1	4-Feb-02	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Schedule Update for Remedial Activities	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	643	
9.1	29-Apr-02	Depot Letter to SCHD Concerning Information on Injection Wells Main Installation	John DeBack The Memphis Depot	692	
9.1	31-May-02	Depot Letter to MDPW Concerning Dunn Field Recovery Well System	Clyde Hunt The Memphis Depot	694	
9.1	4-Jun-02	City of Memphis Letter to Depot Concerning Revised Industrial Wastewater Discharge Agreement Permit	Akil Al-Chokhachi City of Memphis	696	
9.1	13-Aug-02	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Submittal of Revised Site Schedule and Overdue FS	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	707	
9.1	23-Aug-02	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Revised Schedule	John DeBack The Memphis Depot	709	
9.1	3-Sep-02	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning DLA Revised Schedule	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	711	
9.1	22-Jan-03	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning USEPA Concurrence on Five-Year Review Report for IRA, Dunn Field	Winston A. Smith Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	725	
9.1	20-May-03	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Former Pistol Range Verification of Demobilization, Site 60, Site 85	John DeBack The Memphis Depot	736	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	17-Jul-03	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Hazardous Waste Inspection	Herb Nicholson Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	752	
9.1	11-Aug-03	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Status of NOV	Clayton Bullington A, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	755	
9.1	25-Aug-03	USACE Letter to Depot Concerning Statement of Clearance for Dunn Field	John D. Rivenburgh U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	757	
9.1	6-Oct-03	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Requirement to Submit Corrective Action Permit Application	Clayton Bullington A, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	760	
9.1	22-Oct-03	USEPA E-mail to Depot Concerning Request for Extension	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	763	
9.1	8-Dec-03	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Extension of USEPA Review Period for the Intermediate RD Submittal	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	766	
9.1	6-Jan-04	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Notification of Field Activities	John DeBack The Memphis Depot	769	
9.1	27-Jan-04	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Adjustment of Delivery Dates for ROD and MI RD of FFA	John DeBack The Memphis Depot	770	
9.1	9-Mar-04	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning ARARs Requirements for Groundwater Contamination	Jim Haynes, PE Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	780	
9.1	12-Mar-04	Depot Letter to USEPA Concerning Notification of Change of BRAC Project Manager	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	781	
9.1	29-Mar-04	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Corrective Action Permit Application	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	783	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	1-Apr-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Request for Schedule Extension for PRB Intermediate Design, Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	785	
9.1	20-Apr-04	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Soil Investigation Report, PCP Dip Vat and UST PCP Sites	James W. Morrison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	786	
9.1	21-Apr-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Request for Schedule Extension for RD, Final Report, Main Installation	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	787	
9.1	26-Apr-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Draft Revised Master Schedule, Main Installation	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	788	
9.1	3-May-04	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of Schedule Extension for RD, Final Report, Main Installation	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	789	
9.1	11-May-04	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Proposed Schedule Rev.	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	790	
9.1	24-Jun-04	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Corrective Action Permit Application	Clayton A. Bullington, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	793	
9.1	12-Jul-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Draft Revised Master Schedule, Main Installation and Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	796	
9.1	12-Jul-04	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Requested Additional Information for Corrective Action Permit Application	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	797	
9.1	8-Aug-04	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of Revised Schedule for Primary Documents for DDMT	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	799	
9.1	9-Aug-04	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Completeness Determination for Corrective Action Permit Application	Mike Apple Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	806	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	10-Aug-04	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Approval of RD Final Report, Main Installation	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	800	
9.1	24-Sep-04	Depot Letter to TDEC Concerning Withdraw of Submitted Corrective Action Permit Application	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	802	
9.1	21-Oct-04	MOA, Technical Memorandum Report, Early Implementation of Selected Remedy Component to Address Groundwater Contamination West of Dunn Field, Rev 1 (attach found at AR #808)	Michael Dobbs, Defense Distribution Center Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency James W. Morrison, PG, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	811	
9.1	12-Nov-04	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Comments on Work Plan, Early Implementation of Selected Remedy, Dunn Field, Rev 1	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	813	
9.1	15-Nov-04	USEPA Letter to TDEC Concerning Issues for Final RCRA Permit	Jon D. Johnston Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	814	
9.1	16-Nov-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Mobilization for Early Implementation of Selected Remedy, Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	815	
9.1	22-Nov-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Delay of Notice of Land Use Restrictions Report, Main Installation	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	816	
9.1	22-Nov-04	Depot Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Extension Request for BCP, Version 8	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	817	
9.1	19-Jan-05	TDEC Letter to Depot Concerning Denial to Reissue Hazardous Waste Corrective Action Permit	Charles Burroughs Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	819	
9.1	11-Feb-05	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning BCP, Version 8	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	822	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	14-Mar-05	MACTEC Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Mobilization for RA at Disposal Sites, Dunn Field	Thomas C. Holmes MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	826	
9.1	24-Jun-05	DDC-DES-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Notification of Delay in Dunn Field Source Areas RD	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	835	
9.1	4-Aug-05	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-E Concerning Early Implementation of Selected Remedy, IRA Completion Report, Site 79-736	Evan E. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	839	
9.1	8-Aug-05	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-E Concerning Notification of Change of TDEC Project Management	James W. Morison, PG Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	840	
9.1	17-Aug-05	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-E Concerning Comments on Dunn Field RD Investigation Work Plan	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	841	
9.1	12-Sep-05	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-E Concerning Approval of RA Work Plan for Main Installation	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	844	
9.1	22-Sep-05	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-E Concerning Approval on IRA Completion Report for Phase 1 of the Selected Remedy, Dunn Field	Kenneth R. LaPierre Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	846	
9.1	17-Feb-06	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Disposal sites RAWP Addendum 1, Rev. 1	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	879	
9.1	7-Apr-06	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Request for Extension for the Zero Valent Iron (ZVI) Permeable Reactive Barrier (PRB) Implementation Study, Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	855	
9.1	26-Apr-06	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-E Concerning BRAC Cleanup Plan, Version 9	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	857	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	1-May-06	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-E Concerning Annual Operations Report – 2005, Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action – Year Seven	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	858	
9.1	2-May-06	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Mobilization for Main Installation Remedial Action	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	859	
9.1	3-May-06	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Request for Extension for Submittal of the Remedial Design Investigation (RDI) Technical Memorandum (TM), Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	860	
9.1	11-May-06	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning BRAC Cleanup Plan, Version 9/Site Management Plan and Annual Schedule Update for the Defense Depot, Memphis, Tennessee (DDMT)	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	861	
9.1	14-Jun-06	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Notification of 20-day Extension on Review Period for Source Areas Design	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	881	
9.1	25-Aug-06	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE, Re: Approval of Remedial Action Completion Report (RACR) for the Disposal Sites Excavation Phase of the Selected Remedy at Dunn Field	Bozeman, Earl Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	867	
9.1	28-Nov-06	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Request for Extension for the Off-Depot RD, Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	870	
9.1	14-Dec-06	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Request for Extension for the Off-Depot RD, Dunn Field	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	872	
9.1	15-Dec-06	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Request for Extension for the Off-Depot RD, Dunn Field	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	873	
9.1	20-Mar-07	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval Rev. 3 of the Source Areas Remedial Design element of the Dunn Field Remedial Action	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	887	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	30-Mar-07	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 10/Site Management Plan and Annual Schedule Update	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	888	
9.1	4-May-07	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Request for Extension, Dunn Field Revised Proposed Remedial Action Plan	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	893	
9.1	10-May-07	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Request for Extension for Proposed Remedial Action Plan Submittal	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	894	
9.1	14-May-07	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Remedial Action Work Plan	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	898	
9.1	15-May-07	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Mobilization for Source Areas Remedial Action	Michael Dobbs The Memphis Depot	899	
9.1	30-May-07	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Rev. 4 Source Areas Final Remedial Design	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	900	
9.1	2-Jul-07	TDEC letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Notification of change in TDEC Project Management	Evan W. Spann Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	902	
9.1	3-Jul-07	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of Rev. 1 of the Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Remedial Action Work Plan	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	903	
9.1	7-Nov-07	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Request for Extension in Dunn Field Off-Depot Remedial Design	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	912	
9.1	19-Nov-07	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Request for Extension in BRAC Cleanup Plan, Version 11, Rev. 0	Michael Dobbs The Memphis Depot	914	
9.1	19-Nov-07	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Request for Extension on Submittal of Final Off-Depot Remedial Design	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	915	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	19-Nov-07	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Request for Extension in Dunn Field Off-Depot Remedial Design	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	916	
9.1	29-Nov-07	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of Request for Extension of the Draft Site Management Plan/BRAC Cleanup Plan for FY2008	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	917	
9.1	13-Dec-07	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Cessation of Work at TA-3	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	919	
9.1	18-Dec-07	3	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	920	
9.1	29-Jan-08	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning USEPA comments on BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 11	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	922	
9.1	31-Jan-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Second Five-Year Review Rev. 1	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	923	
9.1	5-Mar-08	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 11/Site Management Plan and Annual Schedule Update for the Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	931	
9.1	2-Apr-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 11	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	927	
9.1	2-Apr-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of Dunn Field Source Areas Loess/Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 2	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	928	
9.1	22-May-08	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning RA, Work Plan, Loess/Groundwater, Dunn Field Source Areas, Rev. 3	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	937	
9.1	5-Jun-08	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Loess/Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 3	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	939	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	7-Jul-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Loess/Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 3	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	942	
9.1	10-Jul-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning 2007 Annual Operations Report, Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action Year 9	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	943	
9.1	15-Jul-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning PCP Dip Vat Closure	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	944	
9.1	21-Jul-08	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action 2007 Annual Report	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	945	
9.1	8-Aug-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Off-Depot Groundwater Final Remedial Design Rev. 0	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	948	
9.1	14-Aug-08	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Notification of Delay in Dunn Field Off-Depot Groundwater Remedial Design	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	949	
9.1	26-Aug-08	DDC-DES-EE Letter to USEPA and TDEC Concerning Notification of 20-Day Extension for Final Proposed Plan for Dunn Field	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	950	
9.1	6-Oct-08	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of RD, Off-Depot Groundwater Remedy	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	958	
9.1	8-Oct-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Off-Depot Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	959	
9.1	8-Oct-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Dunn Field Off-Depot Groundwater Final Remedial Design, Rev. 1	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	960	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	24-Oct-08	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Revised Proposed Plan for OU 1, Dunn Field	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	961	
9.1	6-Nov-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Revised Proposed Plan, Rev. 3	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	962	
9.1	7-Nov-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Dunn Field ROD Amendment, Rev. 1	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	963	
9.1	12-Nov-08	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Main Installation EBT/Annual Operations Report, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	964	
9.1	5-Jan-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Dunn Field ROD Amendment, Rev. 2	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	972	
9.1	8-Jan-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Rev. 0 BRAC Cleanup Plan/Site Management Plan for FY09	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	975	
9.1	12-Jan-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 12, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	976	
9.1	16-Jan-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the October 2008 Semiannual Monitoring Report, Dunn Field-Groundwater IRA, year 10	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	977	
9.1	20-Jan-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval to Shut Down the Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action Ground Water Extraction System	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	978	
9.1	18-Mar-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 1 for the Dunn Field Off-Depot Groundwater Remedy	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	983	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	4-May-09	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of Main Installation Source Area Investigation, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	988	
9.1	5-Jun-09	DDC-DES-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC, Request for Extension, Main Installation Remedial Action Completion Report	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	990	
9.1	10-Jun-09	DDC-DES-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Request for Extension, Dunn Field Off Depot Notice of Remedial Action (RAO) Implementation	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	991	
9.1	11-Jun-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of extension request for RA start mobilization date	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	993	
9.1	17-Jun-09	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Mobilization for Off Depot Remedial Action	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	986	
9.1	17-Jun-09	DES-DDC-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC, Notification for Off Depot Remedial Action Mobilization	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	994	
9.1	29-Jun-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action 2008 Annual Report	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	995	
9.1	30-Jun-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of Extension Request, Main Installation Interim Remedial Action Completion Report	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	996	
9.1	30-Jun-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Review of Main Installation Source Area Investigation, Rev. 0	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	997	
9.1	2-Jul-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of the Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action 2008 Annual Report	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	998	
9.1	2-Jul-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Approval of Extension Request, Main Installation Interim Remedial Action Completion Report	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	999	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	2-Sep-09	DDC-DES-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Request for Extension, Main Installation Interim Remedial Action Completion Report	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	1001	
9.1	11-Sep-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Request for Extension, Main Installation Interim Remedial Action Completion Report	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1002	
9.1	21-Oct-09	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of DLA's Demonstration that the Remedial Action Conducted OU-1 (Dunn Field) at the Former Memphis Depot NPL Site is Operating Properly and Successfully	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1003	
9.1	29-Oct-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Main Installation, 2007-2008 Annual Long Term Monitoring Report	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1005	
9.1	2-Nov-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning USEPA Approval of Dunn Field Source Areas Interim Remedial Action Completion Report	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1006	
9.1	10-Nov-09	TDEC Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning TDEC Approval of Dunn Field Source Areas Interim Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1007	
9.1	23-Nov-09	DDC-DES-EE Letter to USEPA/TDEC Concerning Request for Extension, BRAC Cleanup Plan V13	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	1009	
9.1	1-Feb-10	Preliminary Close Out Report	U.S. Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1012	
9.1	18-Feb-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of the Annual Monitoring Report for the Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System, Rev. 0	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1020	
9.1	22-Feb-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Concurrence of Main Installation 2009 Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1021	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	24-Feb-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of the BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 13, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1022	
9.1	24-Feb-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of the Annual Monitoring Report for the Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System, Dunn Field Source Areas Remedial Action Rev. 0	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1023	
9.1	24-Feb-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Concurrence on the Main Installation 2009Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1024	
9.1	1-Mar-10	EPA Letter Regarding Approval of BCP V13 Rev. 0/Site Management Plan and Annual Schedule	Ballard, Turpin Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1481	
9.1	15-Mar-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of DLA's Determination that the Remedial Action Conducted for Operable Units 2, 3 and 4, Main Installation at the Former Memphis Depot NPL Site is Operating Properly and Successfully	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1026	
9.1	23-Mar-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Concurrence with the Annual Long Monitoring Reports Rev. 1 2007 and 2008 Reporting Years for the Main Installation (Operable Units 2,3, and 4)	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1029	
9.1	23-Mar-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of the Interim Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1, for the Main Installation (OUs 2, 3, and 4)	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1030	
9.1	23-Mar-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Concurrence with the Year 2 Performance Monitoring Report for the Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment (EBT) System, Rev. 1 for the Main Installation (Operable Units 2, 3 and 4)	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1031	
9.1	5-Apr-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of Four Remedial Action Completion Reports for the Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	Arthur Collins, Chief, Federal Facilities Branch, U.S. Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1033	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	30-Apr-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Off-Depot Vapor Intrusion Monitoring Report, April 2010 Dunn Field	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1036	
9.1	3-May-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Revised Master Schedule, BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 13 (Rev. 1)	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1037	
9.1	11-Jun-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of the IRA System Removal Work Plan	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1044	
9.1	13-Jul-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Intermediate Aquifer Well Installation Report dated June 30, 2010	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1047	
9.1	13-Jul-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Intermediate Aquifer Well Installation Report	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1048	
9.1	28-Sep-10	DLA Letter to USEPA/TDEC Regarding Proposal for Termination, Federal Facilities Agreement Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	Michael Dobbs, DLA Installation Support for Distribution	1053	
9.1	18-Nov-10	DLA Letter to USEPA/TDEC Regarding Notification of Change of Program Manager	Michael Dobbs, Defense Distribution Center	1440	
9.1	16-Dec-10	USEPA Letter to DDC Regarding Reply to DLA Proposal to Terminate the Federal Facilities Agreement at the Former Memphis Defense Depot, Memphis Tennessee	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1058	
9.1	15-Feb-11	USEPA Letter to DA Regarding Intermediate Aquifer Well Sampling Report and Long Term Monitoring Reports for the Main Installation October 2010, Defense Depot, Memphis Tennessee	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1064	
9.1	17-Mar-11	TDEC Letter to DA Regarding 2010 Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, Main Installation	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1065	
9.1	4-Apr-11	USEPA Letter to DA Regarding Approval of 2010 Long-Term Monitoring Reports for the Main Installation	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1067	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	27-Apr-11	USEPA Letter to DA Regarding Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action 2009 Operations and Closure Report	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1069	
9.1	29-Apr-11	DAIM-ODB Letter to USEPA/TDEC Regarding Notification of Change of Project Manager, Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	John P. DeBack, Department of Army	1070	
9.1	5-May-11	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding FSVE Annual Operations Report, 2009-10 (Year 3), Dunn Field	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1071	
9.1	23-May-11	DA Letter to USEPA/TDEC Regarding Close Out BRAC Cleanup Plan, Rev. 1	Carolyn Jones, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1093	
9.1	29-Aug-11	USEPA Letter to Office of the Chief of Staff for Installation Management Regarding Approval of the Dunn Field Off-Depot Ground Water Interim Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1	Arthur Collins, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1094	
9.1	22-Feb-12	USEPA Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of FY2012 Site Management Plan Rev. 0	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1077	
9.1	30-Apr-12	USEPA Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Dunn Field Off Depot Annual Groundwater Monitoring Report 2011 Rev. 1	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1083	
9.1	4-May-12	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Main Installation Annual Long-Term Monitoring Annual Report 2011 Rev. 1	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1084	
9.1	25-Jul-12	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Dunn Field Off Depot Air Sparge – Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report Year Two	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1087	
9.1	10-Dec-12	USEPA Email to HDR Regarding Approval of Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report Year Five Rev. 0	Turpin Ballard, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1090	
9.1	10-Dec-12	TDEC Email to HDR Regarding Approval of Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report Year Five Rev.	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1091	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	5-Apr-13	TDEC Letter to Office of the Chief of Staff for Installation Management Regarding Approval of the 2012 Annual Long Term Monitoring Report	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1099	
9.1	18-Jun-13	USEPA Letter to DA/TDEC Regarding Notification of Change in USEPA Project Manager	Harold W. Taylor, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1100	
9.1	24-Jun-13	TDEC Letter to Office of the Chief of Staff for Installation Management Regarding Approval of the Proposed Well Installation Memorandum for the Main Installation	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1102	
9.1	23-Jan-14	USEPA Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of 2014 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	Julie L. Corkran, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1114	
9.1	10-Jul-14	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Annual Long Term Monitoring Report – 2013, Rev. 1	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1117	
9.1	11-Jul-14	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year 4, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1118	
9.1	18-Jul-14	USEPA Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Comments on Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year 4, Rev. 0	Julie L. Corkran, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1119	
9.1	6-Aug-14	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Main Installation Year 3 Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Annual Report, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1122	
9.1	10-Sep-14	USEPA Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Notification of Change in USEPA Project Manager	Harold W. Taylor, Environmental Protection Agency Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1123	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	18-Dec-14	USEPA Letter to ACSIM-ODB Regarding Comment Extension for 2015 Site Management Plan	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1127	
9.1	23-Jan-15	Shelby County Health Department Air Compliance Inspection, 23 Jan 15	Pamela H. Lindsey, Shelby County Health Department, Air/Pollution Control Section	1128	
9.1	9-Mar-15	USEPA Letter to ACSIM-ODB Regarding Comment Extension for Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phase 1 Work Plan	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1132	
9.1	10-Mar-15	DA Letter to USEPA Regarding Comment Extension for Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phase 1 Work Plan	Carolyn Jones, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1133	
9.1	16-Apr-15	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Comments on Annual Long-term Monitoring Report-2014, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1137	
9.1	18-May-15	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Main Installation Year 4 EBT Report, Rev. 0	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1182	
9.1	20-May-15	USEPA Letter to ACSIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Annual Long- Term Monitoring Report-2014, Rev. 1	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1140	
9.1	20-May-15	USEPA Letter to ACSIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Main Installation Year Four Enhanced Bioremediation Report, Rev. 0	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1141	
9.1	13-Oct-15	TDEC Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Annual Land Use Control Inspection Reports, 2015	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1148	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	8-Nov-15	USEPA Letter to ACSIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Annual Long Term Monitoring Summary Report, 2015	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1150	
9.1	8-Nov-15	USEPA Letter to ACSIM-ODB Regarding Approval of Annual Land Use Control Inspection Reports, 2015	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1151	
9.1	24-Nov-15	Site Management Plan	Carolyn Jones, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1152	
9.1	1-Dec-15	TDEC E-mail Regarding Request for Extension, 2016 Site Management Plan	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1153	
9.1	6-Dec-15	USEPA E-mail Regarding Approval of Request for Extension, 2016 Site Management Plan	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1154	
9.1	5-Jan-16	DA Letter to USEPA/TDEC Regarding Request for Additional Time Extension, 2016 Site Management Plan	Carolyn Jones, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1156	
9.1	6-Jan-16	USEPA E-mail Regarding Approval of Request for Additional Time Extension, 2016 Site Management Plan	Diedre Lloyd, Environmental Protection Agency, Region IV, Federal Facilities Branch	1157	
9.1	6-Jan-16	TDEC E-mail Regarding Approval of Request for Additional Time Extension, 2016 Site Management Plan	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1158	
9.1	6-May-16	Tennessee	Carolyn Jones, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1164	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	11-May-16	Shelby County Pollution Control Letter to DA Regarding Request for Permit Exemption for Two (2) Soil Remediation Systems (Source#01030-01P) and Cancellation of Permit	Robert Rogers, P.E., Technical Manager, Pollution Control Section, Shelby County Health Department	1165	
9.1	27-Dec-16	DA Letter to USEPA/TDEC Regarding Notification of Change in Army BRAC Program Manager for Defense Depot Memphis	James Foster, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1184	
9.1	6-Jun-18	TDEC Letter Regarding Approval of Conceptual Site Model Rev. 0	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1483	
9.1	26-Nov-19	DA Letter to EPA/TDEC Regarding Request for Extension, 2020 Site Management Plan	James Foster Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1476	
9.1	3-Dec-19	EPA E-mail Regarding Approval of Request for Additional Time Extension, 2020 Site Management Plan	Diedre Lloyd Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1478	
9.1	4-Dec-19	TDEC E-mail Regarding Approval of Request for Additional Time Extension, 2020 Site Management Plan	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1479	
9.1	25-Feb-20	EPA Letter to Army Regarding Comments on Final Garden Soil Sampling Report and Enclosed Site-specific Resident Equation Inputs for Soil	Diedre Lloyd Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1489	
9.1	24-Apr-20	EPA Comments on Main Installation Vapor Intrusion Scoping Meeting Summary	Diedre Lloyd U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1493	
9.1	4-May-20	Response to EPA Comments on Main Installation Vapor Intrusion Scoping Meeting Summary	HDR	1495	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	7-Sep-20	EPA Approval of Groundwater Conceptual Site Model Technical Memorandum Rev. 0 and Army Responses	Diedre Lloyd U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1503	
9.1	30-Nov-20	Army Letter to EPA/TDEC Regarding Request for Extension, 2021 Site Management Plan Rev. 0	James Foster Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1507	
9.1	30-Nov-20	EPA E-mail Regarding Approval of 2021 Site Management Plan Rev. 0 Request for Extension	Diedre Lloyd U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1508	
9.1	2-Aug-21	EPA Letter to Army Regarding Conditional Approval of 2020 Supplemental Remedial Investigation Report, Rev. 1	Diedre Lloyd Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1532	
9.1	4-Aug-21	EPA Letter to Army Regarding Conditional Approval of 2018 Community Involvement Plan	Diedre Lloyd Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1533	
9.1	4-Mar-22	EPA Letter to Amy Regarding Army's Responses to EPA Comments on the Vapor Intrusion Screening Level Assessment Memorandum	Diedre Lloyd Environmental Protection Agency, Region 5	1545	
9.1	19-Apr-22	EPA Letter to Army Regarding Change of Remedial Project Manager Notification	Diedre Lloyd Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1552	
9.1	9-Jun-22	Army Letter to EPA/TDEC Regarding Extension Request for Submittal of Main Installation Focused Feasibility Study	James Foster Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1556	
9.1	9-Jun-22	Army Letter to EPA/TDEC Regarding Extension Request for Submittal of Main Installation Vapor Intrusion Conceptual Site Model	James Foster Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1557	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	14-Jun-22	TDEC Email to Army Regarding Approval of Extension Request for Main Installation Focused Feasibility Study and Vapor Intrusion Conceptual Site Model	Jamie Woods Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1558	
9.1	14-Jun-22	EPA Email to Army Regarding Approval of Extension Request for Main Installation Focused Feasibility Study and Vapor Intrusion Conceptual Site Model	Fernando Martinez-Torres Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1559	
9.1	14-Jun-22	EPA Email to Army Regarding Extension Request for Review of Army's Responses to EPA's Comments on the Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report, Year Ten, Rev. 1	Fernando Martinez-Torres Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1561	
9.1	8-Sep-22	Army Letter Requesting Extension of Main Installation Vapor Intrusion Comprehensive Sampling Plan, Rev. 0	James Foster Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1566	
9.1	8-Sep-22	Army Letter Requesting Second Extension, Main Installation Focused Feasibility Study, Rev. 0	James Foster Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1567	
9.1	10-Oct-23	EPA Letter Regarding Approval of the Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year 11, Revision 1	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1593	
9.1	2-Feb-24	EPA Letter Regarding Approval of the Dunn Field West Vapor Intrusion Sampling and Analysis Plan, Revision 1	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1601	
9.1	26-Apr-24	EPA Letter Regarding Conditional Approval of the 2024 Site Management Plan, Revision 1	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1606	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.1	12-Jun-24	Army Letter Requesting Extension on Draft Proposed Plan for Groundwater Remedial Work at the Main Installation	Foster, James Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1611	
9.1	20-Jun-24	EPA Letter Regarding Conditional Approval of the 2023 Annual Site Inspection Report, Revision 1	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1612	
9.1	21-Jun-24	EPA Letter Regarding Conditional Approval of Extension for Draft Proposed Plan for Groundwater Remedial Work at the Main Installation	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1613	
9.1	24-Jun-24	EPA Letter Regarding Approval of the Main Installation Sampling and Risk Screening Report, Revision 1	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1614	
9.1	25-Jul-24	Army Letter Regarding Fencing at Dunn Field former Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	Foster, James Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1618	
9.1	8-Nov-24	EPA Letter Regarding Fencing at Dunn Field former Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1623	
9.1	8-Nov-24	EPA Letter Regarding Extension Request for Main Installation Focused Feasibility Study and Dunn Field West Explanation of Significant Differences	Torres, Fernando Martinez Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1624	
9.1	2-Dec-24	Army Letter Regarding EPA Letter dated 08 November 2024 discussing the schedule for submission of the Main Installation Groundwater Focused Feasibility Study Response to Comments and revised Focused Feasibility Study; and Revised Proposed Plan	Foster, James Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1627	
9.2		Notice of Land Use Restrictions			
9.2	26-Jan-05	Notice of Land Use Restrictions, Main Installation, Instrument 050144108	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District	821	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
9.2	11-Jun-09	Notice of Land Use Restrictions, Dunn Field, Instrument 09069308	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District	992	
10		BRAC Cleanup Team (BCT)/Site Management Team Meeting Su	mmaries		
10	1-Feb-95	Chemical Warfare Management Plan Meeting Minutes, 18 Jan 95	Hunter S. Sartain CH2M Hill, Inc.	100	
10	19-Sep-95	Chemical Warfare Meeting Minutes Summary, 13 Sep 95	Hunter S. Sartain Mark Corey CH2M Hill, Inc.	129	
10	8-Jan-96	Depot Letter to BCT Members Concerning BCT Ratification	Christine E. Kartman Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	523	
10	24-Jan-96	BCT Meeting Summary, 19 Jan 96	CH2M Hill, Inc.	146	
10	16-Feb-96	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Feb 96	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	151	
10	21-Mar-97	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21 Mar 97	CH2M Hill, Inc.	371	
10	2-Jul-97	BCT/RPM Meeting Minutes, 02 Jul 97	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	253	
10	16-Oct-97	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15-16 Oct 97	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	264	
10	10-Dec-97	BCT Meeting Minutes, 04-06 Aug 97	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	273	
10	10-Dec-97	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17-18 Sep 97	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	274	
10	10-Dec-97	BCT Meeting Minutes, 10 Dec 97	The Memphis Depot	532	
10	26-Jan-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 26 Jan 98	The Memphis Depot	280	
10	19-Feb-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Feb 98	The Memphis Depot	286	
10	18-Mar-98	BCT Strategy Session Minutes, 18 Mar 98	Glenn L. Kaden The Memphis Depot	296	
10	19-Mar-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Mar 98	The Memphis Depot	297	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	23-Apr-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 23 Apr 98	The Memphis Depot	307	
10	22-May-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21-22 May 98	The Memphis Depot	316	
10	19-Jun-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 18-19 Jun 98	The Memphis Depot	322	
10	17-Jul-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16-17 Jul 98	The Memphis Depot	338	
10	21-Aug-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20-21 Aug 98	The Memphis Depot	348	
10	5-Nov-98	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17 Sep 98	The Memphis Depot	536	
10	17-Nov-98	Meeting Minutes, Main Installation Risk Assessment Approach Meeting, 16 Nov 98	CH2M Hill, Inc.	537	
10	21-Jan-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Oct 98	The Memphis Depot	540	
10	21-Jan-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 02 Dec 98	The Memphis Depot	541	
10	24-Feb-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21 Jan 99	The Memphis Depot	545	
10	18-Mar-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Feb 99	The Memphis Depot	546	
10	20-May-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 18 Mar 99	The Memphis Depot	553	
10	17-Jun-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 May 99	The Memphis Depot	556	
10	10-Aug-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17 Jun 99	The Memphis Depot	563	
10	19-Aug-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Jul 99	The Memphis Depot	565	
10	16-Sep-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Aug 99	The Memphis Depot	569	
10	25-Oct-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Sep 99	The Memphis Depot	571	
10	15-Dec-99	BCT Meeting Minutes, 25 Oct 99	The Memphis Depot	572	
10	20-Jan-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Dec 99	The Memphis Depot	578	
10	17-Feb-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Jan 00	The Memphis Depot	580	
10	17-Mar-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17 Mar 00	The Memphis Depot	495	
10	17-Mar-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17 Feb 00	The Memphis Depot	583	
10	19-Apr-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Apr 00	The Memphis Depot	498	
10	16-May-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 May 00	The Memphis Depot	585	
10	18-May-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17-18 May 00	The Memphis Depot	503	
10	23-Aug-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 23 Aug 00	The Memphis Depot	592	
10	28-Aug-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Jul 00	The Memphis Depot	595	
10	6-Oct-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 24 Aug 00	The Memphis Depot	600	
10	19-Oct-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21 Sep 00	The Memphis Depot	605	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	22-Dec-00	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 00	The Memphis Depot	609	
10	18-Jan-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Dec 00	The Memphis Depot	611	
10	27-Feb-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 18 Jan 01	The Memphis Depot	617	
10	16-Apr-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 14 Mar 01	The Memphis Depot	620	
10	19-Jul-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17 May 01	The Memphis Depot	630	
10	16-Aug-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Jul 01	The Memphis Depot	631	
10	16-Aug-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Aug 01	The Memphis Depot	632	
10	20-Dec-01	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Nov 01	The Memphis Depot	641	
10	21-Feb-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Dec 01	The Memphis Depot	645	
10	21-Feb-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21 Feb 02	The Memphis Depot	647	
10	17-Apr-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 17-18 Apr 02	The Memphis Depot	690	
10	20-Jun-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Jun 02	The Memphis Depot	698	
10	15-Aug-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Aug 02	The Memphis Depot	708	
10	24-Sep-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 24 Sep 02	The Memphis Depot	712	
10	21-Nov-02	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21 Nov 02	The Memphis Depot	717	
10	16-Jan-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Jan 03	The Memphis Depot	724	
10	25-Mar-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 25-26 Mar 03	The Memphis Depot	746	
10	14-May-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 14-15 May 03	The Memphis Depot	734	
10	19-Jun-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Jun 03	The Memphis Depot	750	
10	20-Aug-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Aug 03	The Memphis Depot	756	
10	18-Sep-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 18 Sep 03	The Memphis Depot	758	
10	16-Oct-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Oct 03	The Memphis Depot	762	
10	2-Dec-03	BCT Meeting Minutes, 02 Dec 03	The Memphis Depot	765	
10	15-Jan-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Jan 04	The Memphis Depot	778	
10	18-Mar-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 18 Mar 04	The Memphis Depot	782	
10	20-May-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 May 04	The Memphis Depot	791	
10	15-Jun-04	BCT Teleconference Minutes, 15 Jun 04	The Memphis Depot	792	
10	20-Jul-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Jul 04	The Memphis Depot	798	
10	26-Aug-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 25-26 Aug 04	The Memphis Depot	801	
10	21-Sep-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20-21 Sep 04	The Memphis Depot	807	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	20-Oct-04	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Oct 04	The Memphis Depot	810	
10	20-Jan-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Jan 05	The Memphis Depot	820	
10	24-Feb-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 24 Feb 05	The Memphis Depot	823	
10	24-Mar-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 24 Mar 05	The Memphis Depot	827	
10	20-Apr-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Apr 05	The Memphis Depot	829	
10	19-May-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 May 05	The Memphis Depot	830	
10	15-Jun-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 June 05	The Memphis Depot	834	
10	21-Jul-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 21 July 05	The Memphis Depot	837	
10	15-Sep-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Sep 05	The Memphis Depot	845	
10	20-Oct-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Oct 05	The Memphis Depot	847	
10	15-Nov-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Nov 05	The Memphis Depot	848	
10	15-Dec-05	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Dec 05	The Memphis Depot	849	
10	19-Jan-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Jan 06	The Memphis Depot	850	
10	16-Feb-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Feb 06	The Memphis Depot	853	
10	20-Apr-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Apr 06	The Memphis Depot	856	
10	27-Jun-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 27 Jun 06	The Memphis Depot	862	
10	17-Aug-06	BCT teleconference Meeting Minutes, 17 Aug 06	The Memphis Depot	866	
10	28-Sep-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 28 Sep 06	The Memphis Depot	868	
10	19-Oct-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 06	The Memphis Depot	869	
10	16-Nov-06	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Nov 06	The Memphis Depot	882	
10	16-Feb-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Feb 07	The Memphis Depot	885	
10	15-Mar-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Mar 07	The Memphis Depot	886	
10	20-Apr-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Apr 07	The Memphis Depot	890	
10	10-May-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 10 May 07	The Memphis Depot	895	
10	14-Jun-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 14 Jun 07	The Memphis Depot	901	
10	9-Aug-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 9 Aug 07	The Memphis Depot	906	
10	20-Sep-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 20 Sep 07	The Memphis Depot	909	
10	15-Nov-07	BCT Meeting Minutes, 15 Nov 07	The Memphis Depot	913	
10	24-Jan-08	BCT Meeting Minutes, 24 Jan 08	The Memphis Depot	930	
10	3-Apr-08	BCT Meeting Minutes, 3 Apr 08	The Memphis Depot	935	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	5-Jun-08	BCT Meeting Minutes, 5 Jun 08	The Memphis Depot	938	
10	24-Jul-08	BCT Meeting Minutes, 24 Jul 08	The Memphis Depot	946	
10	13-Nov-08	BCT Meeting Minutes, 13 Nov 08	The Memphis Depot	965	
10	8-Jan-09	BCT Meeting Minutes, 8 Jan 09	The Memphis Depot	973	
10	5-Feb-09	BCT Meeting Minutes, 5 Feb 09	The Memphis Depot	979	
10	29-Oct-09	BCT Meeting Minutes, 1 Sep 09	The Memphis Depot	1004	
10	11-Feb-10	BCT Meeting Minutes, 29 Oct 09	The Memphis Depot	1019	
10	28-Apr-10	BCT Meeting Minutes, 11 Feb 2010	Memphis Depot	1035	
10	18-Nov-10	DLA Letter to Depot Redevelopment Corporation Regarding Adjournment of BCT Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	Michael Dobbs, DLA Installation Support for Distribution	1056	
10	10-Nov-11	Site Management Team Meeting Minutes, 10 Nov 11	HDR	1107	
10	9-Feb-12	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 9 Feb 12	HDR	1108	
10	13-Feb-13	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Feb 13	HDR	1110	
10	13-Jun-13	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Jun 13	HDR	1111	
10	29-May-14	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary 29 May 14	HDR	1115	
10	4-Nov-14	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 4 Nov 14	HDR	1125	
10	16-Mar-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 16 Mar 15	HDR	1134	
10	14-Apr-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 14 Apr 15	HDR	1136	
10	12-May-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 12 May 15	HDR	1139	
10	16-Jun-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 16 Jun 15	HDR	1142	
10	14-Jul-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 14 Jul 15	HDR	1143	
10	18-Aug-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 18 Aug 15	HDR	1145	
10	15-Sep-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 15 Sep 15	HDR	1146	
10	13-Oct-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Oct 15	HDR	1147	
10	3-Nov-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 3 Nov 15	HDR	1149	
10	15-Dec-15	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 15 Dec 15	HDR	1155	
10	12-Jan-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 12 Jan 16	HDR	1159	
10	6-Feb-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 9 Feb 16	HDR	1160	
10	8-Mar-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 8 Mar 16	HDR	1161	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	12-Apr-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 12 Apr 16	HDR	1163	
10	17-May-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 17 May 16	HDR	1166	
10	14-Jun-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 14 Jun16	HDR	1168	
10	12-Jul-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 12 Jul 16	HDR	1169	
10	9-Aug-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 9 Aug16	HDR	1172	
10	13-Sep-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Sep 16	HDR	1173	
10	11-Oct-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 11 Oct 16	HDR	1175	
10	8-Nov-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 8 Nov 16	HDR	1176	1
10	10-Dec-16	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 10 Dec 16	HDR	1179	
10	10-Jan-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 10 Jan 17	HDR	1180	
10	14-Mar-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 14 Mar 17	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1185	
10	11-Apr-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 11 Apr 17	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1186	
10	9-May-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 9 May 17	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1187	
10	13-Jun-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Jun 17	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1190	
10	11-Jul-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 11 Jul 17	HDR	1191	
10	8-Aug-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 8 Aug 17	HDR	1192	
10	29-Aug-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 29 Aug 17	HDR	1193	
10	19-Sep-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 19 Sep 17	HDR	1194	
10	10-Oct-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 10 Oct 17	HDR	1196	
10	21-Nov-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 21 Nov 17	HDR	1197	•
10	13-Dec-17	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Dec 17	HDR	1198	
10	9-Jan-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 9 Jan 18	HDR	1199	
10	13-Feb-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Feb 18	HDR	1201	
10	21-Mar-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 21 Mar 18	HDR	1204	
10	10-Apr-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 10 Apr 18	HDR	1207	
10	8-May-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 8 May 18	HDR	1209	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	12-Jun-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 12 Jun 18	HDR	1213	
10	24-Jul-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 24 Jul 18	HDR	1214	
10	14-Aug-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 14 Aug 18	HDR	1215	
10	11-Sep-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 11 Sep 18	HDR	1217	
10	9-Oct-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 9 Oct 18	HDR	1218	
10	13-Nov-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 13 Nov18	HDR	1220	
10	11-Dec-18	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, 11 Dec 18	HDR	1222	
10	15-Jan-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Jan 19	HDR	1224	
10	12-Feb-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Feb 19	HDR	1225	
10	12-Mar-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Mar 19	HDR	1226	
10	14-May-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 19	HDR	1227	
10	11-Jun-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Jun 19	HDR	1228	
10	9-Jul-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Jul 19	HDR	1229	
10	13-Aug-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Aug 19	HDR	1470	
10	10-Sep-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Sep 19	HDR	1472	
10	8-Oct-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Oct 2019	HDR	1474	
10	12-Nov-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Nov 2019	HDR	1475	
10	10-Dec-19	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Dec 2019	HDR	1480	
10	14-Jan-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, Jan 2020	HDR	1485	
10	11-Feb-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, February 2020	HDR	1487	
10	12-Feb-20	Vapor Intrusion Scoping Meeting Summary, February 2020 (finalized May 2020)	HDR	1488	
10	10-Mar-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, March 2020	HDR	1490	
10	13-Apr-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, April 2020	HDR	1492	
10	12-May-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 2020	HDR	1496	
10	9-Jun-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, June 2020	HDR	1499	
10	14-Jul-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, July 2020	HDR	1500	
10	11-Aug-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, August 2020	HDR	1501	
10	8-Sep-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, September 2020	HDR	1504	
10	13-Oct-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, October 2020	HDR	1505	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	10-Nov-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, November 2020	HDR	1506	
10	8-Dec-20	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, December 2020	HDR	1510	
10	12-Jan-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, January 2021	HDR	1513	
10	9-Feb-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, February 2021	HDR	1519	
10	9-Mar-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, March 2021	HDR	1520	
10	13-Apr-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, April 2021	HDR	1522	
10	11-May-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 2021	HDR	1524	
10	8-Jun-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, June 2021	HDR	1527	1
10	13-Jul-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, July 2021	HDR	1530	1
10	10-Aug-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, August 2021	HDR	1531	
10	14-Sep-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, September 2021	HDR	1534	
10	12-Oct-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, October 2021	HDR	1536	
10	9-Nov-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, November 2021	HDR	1537	
10	14-Dec-21	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, December 2021	HDR	1540	
10	11-Jan-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, January 2022	HDR	1541	
10	8-Feb-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, February 2022	HDR	1542	
10	18-Feb-22	Site Management Team Federal Facilities Agreement Call Summary - February 2022	Joan Hutton BRAC Environmental Coordinator, CALIBRE Systems	1548	
10	8-Mar-22	Site Management Team Project Review Meeting Summary, March 2022	HDR	1549	
10	12-Apr-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, April 2022	HDR	1551	1
10	10-May-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 2022	HDR	1554	
10	14-Jun-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, June 2022	HDR	1560	
10	12-Jul-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, July 2022	HDR	1563	
10	9-Aug-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, August 2022	HDR	1565	
10	13-Sep-22	Site Management Teama Monthly Call Summary, September 2022	HDR	1568	
10	19-Oct-22	Site Management Team On-Site Meeting Summary, October 2022	HDR	1571	
10	9-Nov-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, November 2022	HDR	1572	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
10	13-Dec-22	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, December 2022	HDR	1575	
10	17-Jan-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, January 2023	HDR	1576	
10	14-Feb-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, February 2023	HDR	1577	
10	14-Mar-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, March 2023	HDR	1578	
10	11-Apr-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, April 2023	HDR	1583	
10	9-May-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 2023	HDR	1584	
10	13-Jun-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, June 2023	HDR	1585	
10	18-Jul-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, July 2023	HDR	1589	
10	8-Aug-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, August 2023	HDR	1591	
10	12-Sep-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, September 2023	HDR	1592	
10	10-Oct-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, October 2023	HDR	1594	
10	14-Nov-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, November 2023	HDR	1596	
10	12-Dec-23	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, December 2023	HDR	1598	
10	9-Jan-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, January 2024	HDR	1600	
10	9-Feb-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, February 2024	HDR	1602	
10	12-Mar-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, March 2024	HDR	1603	
10	9-Apr-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, April 2024	HDR	1605	
10	14-May-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, May 2024	HDR	1609	
10	16-Jul-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, July 2024	HDR	1617	
10	13-Aug-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, August 2024	HDR	1619	
10	10-Sep-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, September 2024	HDR	1620	
10	8-Oct-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, October 2024	HDR	1622	
10	12-Nov-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, November 2024	HDR	1625	
10	10-Dec-24	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, December 2024	HDR	1628	
10	14-Jan-25	Site Management Team Monthly Call Summary, January 2025	HDR	1629	
10	12-Feb-25	Site Management Team On-Site Meeting Summary, February 2025	HDR	1630	
11		Five Year Reviews			
11	20-Jun-02	Memphis Depot, Dunn Field Pump and Discharge System Five-Year Review	CH2M Hill, Inc.	700	
11	1-Jan-03	Five-Year Review Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	720	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
11	17-Aug-07	DES-DDC-EE Letter to Memphis Depot Restoration Advisory Board Members and Elected Officials Concerning Notification of Five-Year Review	Michael Dobbs Defense Distribution Center	907	
11	1-Dec-07	Second Five-Year Review, Rev. 1	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	918	
11	29-Mar-12	DAIM-ODB Letter to Former Restoration Advisory Board Members and Elected Officials Regarding Notification of the Five-Year Review	Carolyn Jones, Department of Army	1081	
11	1-Nov-12	Third Five-Year Review, Rev. 1	HDR	1095	
11	10-Mar-17	DA Memorandum for Former Memphis Depot Restoration Advisory Board Members, U.S. Environmental Protection Agency and Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation Officials Regarding Notification of Five-Year Review, Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	James Foster, Department of the Army, Office of the Assistant Chief of Staff for Installation Management	1188	
11	1-Mar-18	Fourth Five-Year Review Rev. 2	HDR	1203	
11	14-Mar-22	Army Letter to City of Memphis and Shelby County Elected Officials, Civic Representatives and Former Restoration Advisory Board Members Regarding Notification of the Five Year Review for the Defense Depot Memphis, Tennessee	James Foster Program Manager, Base Realignment and Closure Field Branch	1547	
11	1-Apr-23	Fifth Five-Year Review, Defense Depot Memphis Tennessee, Rev. 1	HDR	1582	
12		Annual BRAC Cleanup/Site Management Plans			
12	1-Sep-94	Site Management Plan	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	75	
12	1-Nov-96	BRAC Cleanup Plan	Woodward-Clyde Federal Services	193	
12	1-Oct-98	Final BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 2	The Memphis Depot Caretaker	376	
12	1-Oct-99	Final BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 3	The Memphis Depot Caretaker	482	
12	1-Oct-00	Final BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 4	The Memphis Depot Caretaker	603	
12	1-Feb-02	Final BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 5	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	648	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
12	1-Sep-02	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 6, Rev 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	710	
12	1-Dec-03	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 7, Rev 2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	764	
12	1-Mar-05	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 8, Rev 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	824	
12	1-Jul-06	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 9, Rev. 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	863	
12	1-Jan-07	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 10, Rev. 1	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	883	
12	1-Mar-08	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 11, Rev. 1	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	926	
12	1-Dec-08	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 12, Rev. 0	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	968	
12	1-Dec-09	BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 13, Rev. 0	HDR e2M	1010	
12	1-May-11	Close Out BRAC Cleanup Plan Version 14, Rev. 1	HDR	1092	
12	1-Nov-11	2012 Site Management Plan, Rev. 0	HDR	1074	
12	1-Nov-12	2013 Site Management Plan, Rev. 0	HDR	1096	
12	1-Jan-14	2014 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1113	
12	1-Mar-15	2015 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1129	
12	1-Apr-16	2016 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1162	
12	1-Feb-17	2017 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1181	
12	1-Jun-18	2018 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1212	
12	22-May-19	2019 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1223	
12	1-Sep-20	2020 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1502	
12	1-Dec-21	2021 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1538	
12	1-Apr-22	2022 Site Management Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1550	
12	1-Apr-23	2023 Site Management Plan, Rev 1	HDR	1579	
12	1-Apr-24	2024 Site Management Plan, Revision 1	HDR	1604	
13		Risk/Health Assessments			
13	6-Oct-95	Public Health Assessment Report	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	131	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
13	18-Apr-96	Health Consultation Drainage Ditch Sediments	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	1441	
13	16-Sep-96	Depot Letter to ATSDR Concerning Perceived Health Threats	Eric W. Holladay Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	182	
13	7-Oct-97	RAB Letter to Depot Concerning ATSDR Public Health Assessment	John L. Garrison, Jr., RAB Member	263	
13	1-Apr-98	Final Preliminary Risk Evaluation Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	303	
13	18-Jun-98	ATSDR Letter to Depot Concerning Draft Community Health Concerns Memorandum	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	320	
13	1-Jan-99	Technical Memorandum Report, Final Streamlined Risk Assessment, Parcel 3	CH2M Hill, Inc.	370	
13	1-May-99	Final Baseline Risk Assessment for Golf Course Impoundments at DDDMT	CH2M Hill, Inc.	1442	
13	13-May-99	ATSDR Letter to Depot Concerning Rescheduling of Meeting And Meeting Purpose, 19 May 99	John R. Crellin Dhelia Williamson Agency for Toxic Substances and	552	
13	23-Jul-99	Technical Memorandum Report, Human Health and Ecological Risk Assessment	CH2M Hill, Inc.	562	
13	16-Aug-00	Health Consultation Report, Assessment of Cancer Incidence	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	803	
13	14-Nov-00	Public Health Assessment Report	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	608	
13	7-May-03	Health Consultation, Evaluation of Results, USEPA investigation of Contaminants in Surface Soils near Surface Water Drainage Ditches from Memphis Depot	Agency for Toxic Substances and Disease Registry	1443	
13	12-May-03	DHHS Letter to Depot Concerning Health Consultation	Max M. Howie Department of Health and Human Services	733	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
13	11-Jun-03	DHHS Letter to Depot Concerning Childhood Leukemia	John R. Crellin Department of Health and Human Services	738	
13	1-Feb-20	Human Health and Ecological Risk Assessment, Rev. 1	HDR	1486	
13	12-Dec-24	Investigation of Cancer Rates Near Two Superfund Sites	Tennessee Department of Health		13.1
14		in Memphis, Shelby County, Tennessee			
14.1		Main Installation			
14.1	1-Jul-98	Record of Decision, Draft, OU-3	CH2M Hill, Inc.	331	
14.1	1-Apr-99	Draft Final EE/CA, Old Paint Shop and Maintenance Area, Parcel 35, Parcel 28	CH2M Hill, Inc.	381	
14.1	1-Aug-99	Final EE/CA, Old Paint Shop and Maintenance Area, Parcel 35, Parcel 28	CH2M Hill, Inc.	773	
14.1	1-Sep-99	Action Memorandum, Old Paint Shop and Maintenance Area, Parcel 35, Parcel 28	CH2M Hill, Inc.	481	
14.1	1-Aug-00	Proposed Plan, Preferred Alternative for Cleanup of Soil and Groundwater Contamination, Main Installation	The Memphis Depot	438	
14.1	1-Feb-01	ROD, Main Installation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	615	
14.2		Dunn Field			
14.2	1-Jul-94	Environmental Assessment, Removal Action for Groundwater	Engineering-Science, Inc.	67	
14.2	1-Dec-94	Proposed Groundwater Action Plan	CH2M Hill, Inc.	87	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
14.2	1-Apr-96	ROD, IRA, Groundwater, Dunn Field, OU-1	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	157	
14.2	1-Jun-99	Engineering Evaluation/Cost Analysis (EE/CA), Removal of Chemical Warfare Materiel, Site 01, Site 19, Site 64	Parsons Engineering Science, Inc.	382	
14.2	1-Apr-00	Action Memorandum, Removal of Chemical Warfare Materiel, Parcel 36	Parsons Engineering Science, Inc.	496	
14.2	1-Jul-02	EE/CA, Rev 1, Dunn Field, Site 60	CH2M Hill, Inc.	701	
14.2	1-Oct-02	Action Memorandum, Rev 1, Site 60	CH2M Hill, Inc.	713	
14.2	1-May-03	Proposed Plan, Dunn Field	The Memphis Depot	730	
14.2	1-Mar-04	ROD, Final, Dunn Field	CH2M Hill, Inc.	779	
14.2	1-Oct-08	Dunn Field Revised Proposed Plan, Rev. 3	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	956	
14.2	1-Jan-09	Dunn Field Record of Decision Amendment, Rev. 3	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	971	
15		Annual Land Use Controls Inspections/Long Term Monitoring			
15.1		Annual Land Use Controls Inspections			
15.1	1-Jul-05	Main Installation Annual Site Inspection, 2005	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	838	
15.1	1-Jul-06	Main Installation Annual Site Inspection, 2006	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	864	
15.1	1-Jul-07	Main Installation Annual Site Inspection, 2007	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	904	
15.1	1-Oct-08	Main Installation Annual Site Inspection, 2008	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	957	
15.1	1-Jul-09	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2009	HDR	1104	
15.1	1-Jul-10	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2010	HDR	1105	
15.1	1-Jul-11	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2011	HDR	1106	
15.1	1-Jul-12	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2012	HDR	1085	
15.1	1-Jul-13	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2013	HDR	1112	
15.1	1-Aug-14	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2014	HDR	1121	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
15.1	1-Aug-15	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2015	HDR	1144	
15.1	1-Jun-16	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2016	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1167	
15.1	1-Apr-18	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2017	HDR	1206	
15.1	7-May-19	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2018	HDR	1469	
15.1	1-Jun-20	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspections, 2019	HDR	1497	
15.1	1-Jun-21	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspection Report, 2020	HDR	1526	
15.1	1-Feb-22	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspection Report, 2021	HDR	1543	
15.1	1-Oct-22	Main Installation and Dunn Field Annual Site Inspection Report, 2022	HDR	1569	
15.1	1-May-24	2023 Annual Site Inspection Report, Revision 1	HDR	1607	
15.2		Main Installation Long Term Monitoring (LTM) Reports			
15.2	1-Feb-06	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, Main Installation	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	851	
15.2	31-Mar-08	Main Installation LTM Technical Memorandum	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	934	
15.2	1-Feb-10	Main Installation Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2007, Rev. 1	HDR e2M	1015	
15.2	1-Feb-10	Main Installation Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2008, Rev. 1	HDR e2M	1016	
15.2	1-Feb-10	Main Installation Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2009, Rev. 0	HDR e2M	1017	
15.2	29-Dec-10	Main Installation October 2010 Long-Term Monitoring Memorandum	HDR	1059	_
15.2	1-Feb-11	Main Installation Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2010	HDR	1062	
15.2	1-Mar-12	Main Installation Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2011, Rev. 1	HDR	1079	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
15.3		Dunn Field Long Term Monitoring Reports			
15.3	1-Feb-11	Off Depot Groundwater 2010 Annual Long Term Monitoring Report	HDR	1061	
15.3	1-Mar-12	Dunn Field Off Depot Annual Groundwater Monitoring Report 2011 Rev. 1	HDR	1080	
15.4		Site-Wide Long Term Monitoring Reports			
15.4	1-Jan-13	Annual Long Term Monitoring Report, 2012, Rev. 0	HDR	1103	
15.4	1-Jul-14	Annual Long Term Monitoring Report, 2013, Rev. 1	HDR	1116	
15.4	1-May-15	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2014, Rev. 1	HDR	1138	
15.4	1-Oct-16	Annual Long Term Monitoring Report, 2015, Rev. 1	HDR	1174	
15.4	1-Oct-17	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2016, Rev. 1	HDR	1195	
15.4	1-Dec-18	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2017, Rev. 1	HDR	1221	
15.4	1-Sep-19	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2018, Rev. 1	HDR	1473	
15.4	1-Jan-21	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2019, Rev. 1	HDR	1512	
15.4	1-Mar-22	Annual Long-Term Monitoring Report, 2020, Rev. 1	HDR	1544	
15.4	1-Dec-22	Annual Long Term Monitoring Report, 2021, Rev. 1	HDR	1574	
15.4	1-Jul-23	Annual Long Term Monitoring Report – 2022	HDR	1587	
15.4	1-Oct-24	Annual Long Term Monitoring Report – 2023, Revision 1	HDR	1621	
16		Removal Actions (RA)/Remedial Actions Reports			
16.1		Main Installation			
16.1	24-Feb-86	Summary Report, On-Site Remedial Activities	O H Materials Co.	6	
16.1	1-Mar-99	Post Removal Report, Contaminated Soil Remediation, Cafeteria Bldg	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	377	
16.1	1-Mar-99	Post Removal Report, Contaminated Soil Remediation, Family Housing Area, Vol I of II	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	378	
16.1	1-Mar-99	Post Removal Report, Contaminated Soil Remediation, Family Housing Area, Vol II of II	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	379	
16.1	15-Sep-00	Remediation Report, Removal Action	Jacobs-Sverdrup, Inc.	599	
16.1	1-Nov-01	Decontamination Report and Certification for Closure, Site 35	Jacobs Engineering Group	637	
16.1	15-Feb-02	Remediation Report, Site 83	Jacobs Federal Programs	644	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.1	1-Jul-08	Main Installation Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Year One Remedial Action Operations Report, Rev. 0	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	941	
16.1	1-Feb-10	Main Installation Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Year Two Remedial Action Operations Report, Rev. 1	HDR e2M	1013	
16.1	1-Feb-10	Main Installation Interim Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1	HDR e2M	1014	
16.1	30-Jun-10	Intermediate Aquifer Well Installation Main Installation	HDR e ² M	1045	
16.1	30-Dec-10	Main Installation October 2010 Intermediate Aquifer Groundwater Samples Memorandum	HDR	1060	
16.1	1-Feb-12	December 2011 Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Baseline Sample Report	HDR	1078	
16.1	5-Jul-12	Main Installation Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment System and Well Abandonment Report	HDR	1086	
16.1	1-Apr-14	Main Installation Year Three Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Report, Rev. 0	HDR	1124	
16.1	1-Mar-15	Main Installation Year Four Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Report, Rev. 0	HDR	1130	
16.2		Dunn Field			
16.2	1-Aug-01	Construction Report, Updated Groundwater Interim Remedial Action	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	1444	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol I of XXVIII, Text, Appendices A-D	UXB International, Inc.	654	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol II of XXVIII, Appendices E-L	UXB International, Inc.	655	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol III of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Quality Control	UXB International, Inc.	656	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol IV of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COE130194, COE190257	UXB International, Inc.	657	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol V of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COE230195, COE240180	UXB International, Inc.	658	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol VI of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COE260147, COE310132	UXB International, Inc.	659	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol VII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COF020191, COF080328	UXB International, Inc.	660	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol VIII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COF140185, COF230254	UXB International, Inc.	661	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol IX of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COF260151, COF290193	UXB International, Inc.	662	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol X of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COF300207	UXB International, Inc.	663	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XI of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COG130203R1, COG200210	UXB International, Inc.	664	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COG220122	UXB International, Inc.	665	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XIII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COG270302	UXB International, Inc.	666	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XIV of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COH120157	UXB International, Inc.	667	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XV of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COH150146	UXB International, Inc.	668	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XVI of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COH160154	UXB International, Inc.	669	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XVII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, COH170113	UXB International, Inc.	670	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XVIII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COH220139, COH260118	UXB International, Inc.	671	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XIX of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COH310206, COI220208	UXB International, Inc.	672	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XX of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COI280138, COJ140161	UXB International, Inc.	673	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXI of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COJ310200, COK150188	UXB International, Inc.	674	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Reports, COK220253, C1B090228	UXB International, Inc.	675	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXIII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, C1B220250	UXB International, Inc.	676	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXIV of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, C1B230148	UXB International, Inc.	677	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXV of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, C1C150304	UXB International, Inc.	678	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXVI of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, C1C210184	UXB International, Inc.	679	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXVII of XXVIII, Appendix M, Analytical Report, C1C220173	UXB International, Inc.	680	
16.2	1-Dec-01	RA, Final Report Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Vol XXVIII of XXVIII, Appendices N-Q	UXB International, Inc.	681	
16.2	1-Apr-03	Remediation Report, Removal Action, Site 60	Jacobs Federal Programs	729	
16.2	1-Sep-05	Early Implementation of Selected Remedy Interim Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	842	
16.2	1-Jul-06	Disposal Sites Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	865	
16.2	30-Sep-08	Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Operations Summary #7, Dunn Field Source Areas Remedial Action	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	954	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.2	1-Dec-08		engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	969	
16.2	8-Jan-09	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	974	
16.2	1-Jun-09	Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report-2007/2008 Year One	e^2M	1050	
16.2	3-Jun-09	Operating Properly and Successfully Demonstration, Source Areas Remedial Action, Dunn Field	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	989	
16.2	1-Sep-09	Source Areas Interim Remedial Action Completion Report, Rev. 1	HDR e ² M	1000	
16.2	1-Nov-09	Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report 2008/2009 Year Two	HDR e ² M	1051	
16.2	23-Apr-10	Off Depot Vapor Intrusion Monitoring March 2010 Memorandum	HDR e2M	1034	
16.2	1-Oct-10	Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System Year 3 Annual Operations Report 2009/10	HDR e ² M	1054	
16.2	15-Feb-11	IConfirmation Soil Sampling Report	HDR	1063	
16.2	1-Jul-11	Dunn Field Off Depot Groundwater Interim Remedial Action Completion Report Rev. 1	HDR	1072	
16.2	1-Nov-11	Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year Four	HDR	1075	
16.2	1-Apr-12	Dunn Field Off Depot Air Sparge – Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report Year Two Rev. 0	HDR	1082	
16.2	1-Sep-12	Dunn Field Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report Year Five Rev. 0	HDR	1088	
16.2	1-Feb-13	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction System, Annual Operations Report, Year Three	HDR	1097	
16.2	1-Feb-13	Off Depot AS/SVE System Annual Operations Report, Year Three, Rev. 0	HDR	1109	
16.2	1-Aug-14	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year Four, Rev. 1	HDR	1120	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.2	1-Aug-16	Off Depot Air Sparge – Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year Five, Rev. 1	HDR	1170	
16.2	1-Jun-18	Off Depot Air Sparge Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year Six, Rev.1	HDR	1210	
16.2	1-Nov-18	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction System Annual Operations Report, Year Seven, Rev. 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1219	
16.2	1-Jun-20	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report, Year Eight, Rev. 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1517	
16.2	1-Jul-21	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report, Year Nine, Rev. 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1528	
16.2	1-Jul-22	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report, Year Ten, Rev. 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1562	
16.2	1-Jul-23	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report, Year Eleven, Revision 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1588	
16.2	1-Jul-24	Off Depot Air Sparge/Soil Vapor Extraction Annual Operations Report, Year Twelve, Revision 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1616	
16.3		Groundwater Interim Remedial Action (IRA)			
16.3	19-Mar-98	IRA, Groundwater Report, Dunn Field	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	299	
16.3	1-May-99	IRA, Groundwater Extraction System Report, Vol I of II, Dunn Field	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	478	
16.3	1-May-99	IRA, Groundwater Extraction System Report, Vol II of II, Dunn Field	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	479	
16.3	1-May-00	IRA, Quarterly Groundwater Report, Year Two, First Quarter	IT Corp.	775	
16.3	1-Jul-00	IRA, Quarterly Groundwater Report, Year Two, Second Quarter	IT Corp.	776	
16.3	15-Oct-00	IRA, Quarterly Groundwater Quality Report, Year Two, Third Quarter	Jacobs-Sverdrup, Inc.	604	
16.3	29-Jan-01	IRA, Quarterly Groundwater Quality Report, Year Two, Fourth Quarter	Jacobs Engineering Group	613	
16.3	29-Jan-01	IRA, Groundwater Annual O&M Summary Report, FY00	Jacobs Engineering Group	614	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.3	1-Jun-01	IRA, Semi-Annual Groundwater Quality Report, OU-1	Jacobs Engineering Group	626	
16.3	1-Feb-02	IRA, Groundwater Annual O&M Summary Report, FY01	Jacobs Federal Programs	642	
16.3	1-Feb-02	IRA, Semi-Annual Groundwater Quality Report, Year Three, Second Half	IT Corp.	777	
16.3	1-Jun-02	IRA, Semi-Annual Groundwater Quality Report, Year Four, First Half	Jacobs Federal Programs	695	
16.3	1-Dec-02	IRA, Semi-Annual Groundwater Quality Report, Year Four, Second Half	Jacobs Federal Programs	719	
16.3	1-Jan-03	IRA, Annual Groundwater O&M Summary Report	Jacobs Federal Programs	721	
16.3	1-Jun-03	IRA, Semi-Annual Groundwater Quality Report, Year Five, First Half	Jacobs Federal Programs	747	
16.3	1-Jan-04	IRA, Annual Groundwater O&M Summary Report, 03	Jacobs Federal Programs	767	
16.3	1-Jan-04	IRA, Semi-Annual Groundwater Quality Report, Year Five, Second Half	Jacobs Federal Programs	768	
16.3	1-Oct-04	IRA, Semi-Annual Summary Report, Year Six, First Half, Dunn Field	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	832	
16.3	1-Jun-05	IRA, Annual Operations Report 04, Dunn Field Groundwater, Year Six, Rev. 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	833	
16.3	17-Feb-06	Annual Report – 2005, Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action – Year Seven, Rev. 0	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	852	
16.3	7-Dec-06	Semi-annual Status Report, 2006, Dunn Field Groundwater, Year Eight, First Half	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	871	
16.3	1-Feb-07	Annual Operations Report – 2006, Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action – Year Eight, Rev. 0	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	884	
16.3	1-Mar-08	Annual Operations Report 2007, Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action – Year Nine	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	932	
16.3	1-Jun-08	Semiannual Monitoring Report, Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action, Year Ten	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	940	
16.3	1-Dec-08	October 2008 Semiannual Monitoring Report, Dunn Field - Groundwater IRA, Year Ten	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	970	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
16.3	1-Mar-09	Dunn Field Groundwater Interim Remedial Action Annual Operations Report – 2008, Year Ten	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	982	
16.3	17-Mar-10	Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action October 2009 Semiannual Monitoring Report, Year Eleven	HDR e2M	1027	
16.3	1-Dec-10	Dunn Field Interim Remedial Action 2009 Operations and Closure Report	HDR	1057	
17		Remedial Design (RD)			
17.1		Main Installation			
17.1	1-Jul-04	RD, Final Report, Main Installation, Rev 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	794	
17.2		Dunn Field			
17.2	1-Apr-04	RD, Final Report, Disposal Sites at Dunn Field, Rev 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	784	
17.2	1-Apr-07	Source Areas Remedial Design, Rev. 4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	889	
17.2	1-Jul-07	RD, Off-Depot Groundwater Pre-Final, Rev 1, Appendices B and D, Dunn Field	CH2M Hill, Inc.	929	
17.2	1-Sep-08	Final Off-Depot Groundwater Remedial Design, Rev. 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	951	
17.2	1-Sep-08	Final Off-Depot Groundwater Remedial Design, Rev. 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	952	
17.2	1-Sep-08	Final Off-Depot Groundwater Remedial Design, Rev. 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	953	
18		Remedial Investigations (RI)/Supplemental Investigation Reports	s		
18	1-Aug-90	RI, Final Report, Vol I of II	Law Environmental, Inc.	17	
18	1-Aug-90	RI, Final Report, Vol II of II, Appendices	Law Environmental, Inc.	18	
18	1-May-91	RI/FS, Report, Annex B for Follow On Investigation and Interim Remedial Measure for Contaminated Groundwater	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	21	
18	1-Jan-00	RI, Final Report, Vol I of VI, Sections 1-15, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	486	
18	1-Jan-00	RI, Final Report, Vol II of VI, Sections 16-36, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	487	
18	1-Jan-00	RI, Final Report, Vol III of VI, Appendices A-M, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	488	
18	1-Jan-00	RI, Final Report, Vol IV of VI, Appendices N-BB, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	489	
18	1-Jan-00	RI, Final Report, Vol V of VI, Appendix E, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	490	
18	1-Jan-00	RI, Final Report, Vol VI of VI, Appendices V-X and AA, OU-2, OU-3, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	491	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
18	1-Jul-02	RI, Report, Vol I of III, Rev 2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	702	
18	1-Jul-02	RI, Report, Vol II of III, Appendices A-1-B, Rev 2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	703	
18	1-Jul-02	RI, Report, Vol III of III, Appendices C-1-K, Rev 2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	704	
18	1-Jun-18	Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phases 1 and 2 Report, Rev. 1	HDR	1211	
18	1-Jun-20	Groundwater Conceptual Site Model Technical Memorandum Rev. 1	HDR	1498	
18	1-Jul-21	2020 Supplemental Remedial Investigation Report, Rev. 1	HDR	1529	
18	1-Apr-23	Dunn Field West Post-ROD Supplemental Investigation Report, Rev. 1	HDR	1580	
18	1-May-24	Main Installation Sampling and Risk Screening Report, Revision 1	HDR	1608	
18	28-Feb-25	Dunn Field West Data Collection Memorandum	HDR		18.1
18	8-Jul-25	Dunn Field West Round 2 Soil Sampling Memorandum	HDR		18.2
19		Feasibility Studies (FS)			
19	1-Sep-90	FS, Final Report	Law Environmental, Inc.	19	
19	1-Aug-93	Focused FS, Report, Dunn Field	Engineering-Science, Inc.	38	
19	1-Jul-94	Focused FS, Final Report, Dunn Field	Engineering-Science, Inc.	66	
19	1-Jul-00	FS, Soils Report, Main Installation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	510	
19	1-Jul-00	FS, Groundwater Report, Main Installation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	511	
19	1-Feb-03	FS, Report, Rev 1, Dunn Field	CH2M Hill, Inc.	579	
19	1-Jul-24	Final Main Installation Focused Feasibility Study Report	HDR	1615	
20		Additional Site Studies			
20	1-Jul-82	Installation Assessment Report	Chemical Systems Laboratory	2	
20	20-Jan-83	Geologic Study	U.S. Army Environmental Hygiene Agency	3	
20	25-Nov-85	Environmental Audit Report	U.S. Army Environmental Hygiene Agency	5	
20	30-Jul-86	Water Quality Biological Study	U.S. Army Environmental Hygiene Agency	7	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
20	7-Aug-87	Groundwater Consultation Report, Collection and Analysis of Groundwater Samples	U.S. Army Environmental Hygiene Agency	8	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol I of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	44	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol II of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	45	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol III of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	46	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol IV of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	47	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol V of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	48	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol VI of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	49	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol VII of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	50	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol VIII of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	51	
20	1-Jan-94	Groundwater Monitoring Results Report, Vol IX of IX	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	52	
20	1-Mar-94	Final Electromagnetic and Magnetic Survey Report, Dunn Field	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	56	
20	1-Sep-94	No Further Action Sites, Draft Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	74	
20	1-Jan-95	Archives Search Report, Conclusions and Recommendations	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - St Louis District	95	
20	1-Jan-95	Archives Search Report, Findings	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - St Louis District	96	
20	10-Mar-95	Technical Memorandum Report, Selection of Early Removal Sites	Edward R. Underwood CH2M Hill, Inc.	102	
20	17-Mar-95	Technical Memorandum Report, Early Removal Sites	CH2M Hill, Inc.	521	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
20	16-Nov-95	Summary of Inventory Report	Edward R. Underwood CH2M Hill, Inc.	133	
20	30-Jan-96	Sediment Sampling Analysis Report	EDAW, Inc.	148	
20	1-Apr-96	Lead-Based Paint Risk Assessment for the DDDMT	Barge Waggoner Sumner and Cannon	1451	
20	4-Mar-97	Groundwater Sampling Data, Feb 96	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	215	
20	4-Mar-97	Groundwater Sampling Data, Feb 96	Glenn L. Kaden Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	216	
20	1-May-97	Draft Executive Summary Report, Screening Sites Sampling Program	CH2M Hill, Inc.	245	
20	20-Jul-97	Technical Memorandum Report, Criteria and Background Data for Screening and Site Evaluation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	529	
20	1-Aug-97	Final Groundwater Characterization Data Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	256	
20	1-Sep-97	Quarterly Groundwater Monitoring Report, Jun 97	CH2M Hill, Inc.	258	
20	1-Nov-97	Quarterly Groundwater Monitoring Report, Sep 97	CH2M Hill, Inc.	266	
20	1-Feb-98	Geophysical Survey Work Report, Jan-Feb 98, Dunn Field	OHM Remediation Services Corp.	281	
20	1-Mar-98	Groundwater Monitoring Report, Mar 98	CH2M Hill, Inc.	291	
20	1-Mar-98	Screening Sites Letter Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	292	
20	1-May-98	Final Background Sampling Program Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	308	
20	1-May-98	RI Sites Letter Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	309	
20	18-May-98	Draft Technical Memorandum Report, Results of Pesticide Vertical Profile Sampling	Greg Underberg Justin Treadwell CH2M Hill, Inc.	314	
20	29-May-98	Addenda to Specifications from Contaminated Surface Soil Remediation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	317	
20	1-Jul-98	Selection Criteria Report, Passive Soil Gas Technology	W L Gore and Associates, Inc.	330	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
20	15-Jul-98	Technical Memorandum Report, Passive Soil Gas Survey, Dunn Field	Tom Beisel CH2M Hill, Inc.	335	
20	1-Sep-98	Historical Environmental Aerial Photographic Analysis, Final Report, Dunn Field	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	464	
20	1-Sep-98	Historical Environmental Aerial Photographic Analysis, Final Report, Main Depot Area	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	465	
20	16-Sep-98	Draft Technical Memorandum Report, Passive Soil Gas Survey, Dunn Field	Tom Beisel, CH2M Hill, Inc.	358	
20	1-Dec-98	Technical Memorandum Report, Passive Soil Gas Survey	CH2M Hill, Inc.	538	
20	13-Jan-99	Technical Memorandum Report, Additional Sampling Data Results	CH2M Hill, Inc.	539	
20	1-Sep-99	Final Report, Evaluation of Bioremediation Technology	CH2M Hill, Inc.	1448	
20	1-Sep-99	Draft Final Technical Memorandum Report, Basis for NFA Recommendations	CH2M Hill, Inc.	774	
20	16-Mar-00	Technical Memorandum Report, Evaluation of Recreational Land Use Scenarios, OU-3	CH2M Hill, Inc.	582	
20	1-Dec-00	Field Sampling Investigation Report	Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	804	
20	14-Nov-02	Technical Memorandum Report, Analysis of Groundwater Data Collected During Main Installation Wide Baseline Groundwater Sampling Event	CH2M Hill, Inc.	744	
20	12-Aug-03	Technical Memorandum Report, Installation of Up-Gradient Monitoring Wells, Dunn Field	Jacobs Federal Programs	743	
20	21-Jan-04	Technical Memorandum Report, Results of Soil Investigation at Former PCP Dip Vat and Underground PCP Storage Tank Sites, Main Installation	CH2M Hill, Inc.	551	
20	14-Oct-04	Technical Memorandum Report, Early Implementation of Selected Remedy Component to Address Groundwater Contamination West of Dunn Field, Rev 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	808	
20	6-Feb-08	Monitoring Well Replacement, Dunn Field FOST 4 Property Technical Memorandum	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	925	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
20	1-Mar-08	Main Installation Source Area Evaluation, Rev. 2	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	933	
20	1-Feb-09	Main Installation Source Area Investigation Rev. 0	Engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	987	
20	29-Nov-17	Data Collection at TDEC Wells, Dunn Field, Memorandum	HDR	1482	
20	1-Feb-18	Membrane Interface Probe Survey Report, Dunn Field, Rev. 1	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1200	
20	1-Dec-19	Final Garden Soil Sampling Report	HDR	1484	
20	1-Feb-22	Final Main Installation Soil Vapor Extraction Pilot Test Extension Report	HDR		20.1
20	1-Jun-22	Vapor Intrusion Conceptual Site Model, Rev. 1	HDR	1555	
20	1-Oct-22	Offsite Groundwater Investigation Report, Rev. 1	HDR	1570	
20	1-Aug-23	Preliminary Assessment of Per- and Polyfluoroalkyl Substances at Defense Depot Memphis Tennessee, Final	Leidos	1590	
20	1-Nov-23	Site Investigation Report for Per- and Polyfluoroalkyl Substances at Defense Depot Memphis Tennessee, Final	Leidos	1595	
21		Work Plans			
21	1-Jan-89	Remedial Investigation (RI)/Feasibility Study (FS), Final Work Plan	Law Environmental, Inc.	9	
21	1-Dec-93	RI/FS, Executive Summary for Generic Work Plan	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	42	
21	1-Aug-95	Hazardous and Toxic Waste HSP	CH2M Hill, Inc.	118	
21	1-Sep-95	Field Sampling Plan (FSP), Screening Sites	CH2M Hill, Inc.	121	
21	1-Sep-95	RI/FS, Draft Final Generic Work Plan	CH2M Hill, Inc.	126	
21	2-Jan-97	Technical Memorandum Report, Filter Pack and Well Screen Specifications	CH2M Hill, Inc.	527	
21	15-Jan-98	Technical Memorandum Report, Groundwater Monitoring Sampling Strategy	CH2M Hill, Inc.	533	
21	8-May-98	Technical Memorandum, FSP for Additional Groundwater Investigations	Underberg, Greg CH2M Hill, Inc.	312	
21	18-Aug-98	Technical Memorandum, Draft FSP Addendum, Screening Sites	CH2M Hill, Inc.	343	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
21	25-Sep-98	Technical Memorandum, Final FSP Addendum, Screening Sites	CH2M Hill, Inc.	366	
21	15-Mar-00	Technical Memorandum, Amended SAP	CH2M Hill, Inc.	581	
21	1-Apr-02	RD, Work Plan, Rev 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	742	
21	1-Jul-02	RD, Work Plan, Rev 2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	705	
21	1-Nov-05	Remedial Action Sampling and Analysis Plan Volume I: Field Sampling Plan	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	876	
21	1-Mar-15	Site Safety and Health Plan, Rev. 0	HDR	1131	
21	1-Mar-18	DDMT Uniform Federal Policy – Quality Assurance Project Plan Rev. 1	HDR	1202	
21	UNK	SOW, Ordnance, Explosive Waste, and Chemical Warfare Materiel Sub-Surface Clearance	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	369	
21.1		Main Installation			
21.1	1-Sep-95	Draft Final FSP, OU-2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	122	
21.1	1-Sep-95	FSP, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	124	
21.1	1-Sep-95	FSP, OU-3	CH2M Hill, Inc.	125	
21.1	1-Dec-97	Baseline Risk Assessment HSP and SAP, Golf Course Impoundments	Radian Corp.	268	
21.1	1-Jul-98	Draft SAP for Fish Sampling	Radian Corp.	326	
21.1	18-Aug-98	Technical Memorandum, Draft FSP Addendum, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	344	
21.1	18-Aug-98	Technical Memorandum, Draft FSP Addendum, OU-3	CH2M Hill, Inc.	345	
21.1	18-Aug-98	Technical Memorandum, Draft FSP Addendum, OU-2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	346	
21.1	25-Sep-98	Technical Memorandum, Final FSP Addendum, OU-2	CH2M Hill, Inc.	363	
21.1	25-Sep-98	Technical Memorandum, Final FSP Addendum, OU-3	CH2M Hill, Inc.	364	
21.1	25-Sep-98	Technical Memorandum, Final FSP Addendum, OU-4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	365	
21.1	5-Jun-01	Technical Memorandum, Data Collection Plan for Long-Term Operational Areas	CH2M Hill, Inc.	627	
21.1	15-Jun-01	Technical Memorandum Report, Data Collection Plan for LTO Areas, Table 4	CH2M Hill, Inc.	628	
21.1	1-Aug-03	PCP Dip Vat Soil Investigation Work Plan, Rev 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	753	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
21.1	1-Jul-05	RA, Final Work Plan, Main Installation, Rev. 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	836	
21.1	1-Apr-06	Remedial Action Health and Safety Plan, Main Installation	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	880	
21.1	1-Aug-08	Main Installation Source Area Investigation Work Plan	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	947	
21.1	24-Mar-10	Work Plan for Deep Wells and 2010 Long-Term Monitoring Main Installation	HDR e2M	1032	
21.1	24-Oct-11	Work Plan for Partial Abandonment of Enhanced Bioremediation System, Main Installation	HDR	1073	
21.1	1-Oct-12	Main Installation Enhanced Bioremediation Treatment Remedial Action Work Plan Addendum Rev. 0	HDR	1089	
21.1	13-May-13	Technical Memorandum, Proposed Well Installation – Main Installation	HDR	1101	
21.1	8-Apr-15	Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phase 1 Work Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1135	
21.1	29-Aug-16	Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phase 2 Work Plan – Memorandum, Rev. 1	HDR	1171	
21.1	1-Apr-18	Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phase 3 QAPP, Rev. 1	HDR	1205	
21.1	1-Sep-18	Main Installation Vapor Intrusion Soil Gas Sampling QAPP, Rev. 1	HDR	1216	
21.1	28-Aug-19	Main Installation Supplemental Remedial Investigation Phase 4 QAPP	HDR	1471	
21.1	1-May-22	Human Health and Environmental Risk Assessment Sampling and Analysis Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1553	
21.1	1-Apr-23	Vapor Intrusion Sampling and Analysis Plan, Main Installation, Rev. 1	HDR	1581	
21.2		Dunn Field			
21.2	1-Jul-92	Final Work Plan, Pump Test	Engineering-Science, Inc.	26	
21.2	1-Sep-95	FSP, OU-1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	123	
21.2	1-Jan-96	SOW, Appendix Annex for Chemical Warfare Materiel, Sampling Associated with RI/FS	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	137	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
21.2	1-Jan-98	EE/CA, Work Plan to Conduct Site Characterization, OU-1	Parsons Engineering Science, Inc.	277	
21.2	1-Jul-98	EE/CA, Final Work Plan to Conduct Site Characterization, OU-1	Parsons Engineering Science, Inc.	327	
21.2	2-Mar-99	Technical Memorandum, Final FSP Addendum, OU-1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	474	
21.2	1-Jun-99	Final Transportation Plan, Site 01, Site 09, Site 64	AMCPM-NSM	384	
21.2	1-Jan-00	RA, Final Safety Submission Report, Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Book 1, Vol I and II of III, OU-1	UXB International Inc.	574	
21.2	1-Jan-00	RA, Final Safety Submission Report, Chemical Warfare Materiel Investigation, Book 2, Vol III of III, OU-1	UXB International Inc.	575	
21.2	13-Mar-00	Technical Memorandum, SAP for Evaluation of Biodegradation of VOCs in Groundwater	CH2M Hill, Inc.	493	
21.2	1-Jun-00	Final Field Sampling Plan Addendum II for Dunn Field, Operable Unit 1	CH2M Hill, Inc.	1450	
21.2	9-Mar-01	Transportation and Disposal Plan, Contaminated Waste, OU-1	UXB International, Inc.	618	
21.2	11-Apr-01	SOW, RA, Lead Contamination Soil Removal	CH2M Hill, Inc.	619	
21.2	5-May-01	Transportation and Disposal Plan, CWM, Correction 01	Harry L. Spear, Col U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Huntsville District	623	
21.2	1-Oct-01	Soil Vapor Extraction Treatability Study Work Plan	CH2M Hill, Inc.	636	
21.2	25-Nov-02	Pistol Range Site Remediation Work Plan Addendum, Site 60	Kraig Smith, Jacobs Engineering	718	
21.2	1-Aug-03	Disposal Sites Pre-Design Investigation Data Collection Plan, Rev 2, Dunn Field	CH2M Hill, Inc.	754	
21.2	15-Oct-04	RA, Work Plan, Disposal Sites at Dunn Field, Rev 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	809	
21.2	1-Nov-04	Work Plan, Early Implementation of Selected Remedy, Dunn Field, Rev 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	812	
21.2	1-Sep-05	Final Dunn Field RD Investigation Work Plan	CH2M Hill, Inc.	843	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
21.2	1-Feb-06	Dunn Field Disposal Sites Remedial Action Work Plan Addendum 1, Rev. 1	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	878	
21.2	1-Apr-06	Final Zero Valent Iron Permeable Reactive Barrier Implementation Study Work Plan, Dunn Field	CH2M Hill, Inc.	854	
21.2	1-May-07	Dunn Field Source Areas Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 1	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	891	
21.2	1-May-07	Source Areas Remedial Action Health and Safety Plan	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	892	
21.2	1-Aug-07	Intermediate Aquifer Investigation Work Plan	CH2M Hill, Inc.	1466	
21.2	1-Aug-07	Dunn Field Intermediate Aquifer Investigation Work Plan, Rev. 0	CH2M Hill, Inc.	905	
21.2	19-Dec-07	Health and Safety Plan Amendment – Excavation Activities at Dunn Field Technical Memorandum	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	921	
21.2	1-Feb-08	Dunn Field Source Areas Loess/Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 2	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	924	
21.2	1-May-08	Dunn Field Source Areas Loess/Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 3	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	936	
21.2	1-Apr-09	Off Depot Groundwater Remedial Action Work Plan, Rev. 2	engineering-environmental Management, Inc.	984	
21.2	5-Dec-09	Off Depot Vapor Intrusion Baseline Monitoring	HDR/e2M	1449	
21.2	19-Mar-10	Work Plan for Off Depot Groundwater Sampling	HDR e2M	1028	
21.2	1-May-10	Interim Remedial Action (IRA) System Removal Work Plan Memorandum	HDR e2M	1039	
21.2	20-Oct-10	Work Plan for Fluvial Soil Vapor Extraction Confirmation Sampling, Rev. 1	HDR e2M	1055	
21.2	1-Dec-16	UFP-QAPP Off Depot Air Sparge Well Installation Work Plan	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1177	
21.2	1-Dec-16	UFP-QAPP Membrane Interface Probe Survey Work Plan	Trinity Analysis & Development Corp.	1178	
21.2	1-Feb-20	Final MW-87 Area Investigation Work Plan	HDR	1518	
21.2	1-May-20	Dunn Field Offsite Groundwater Investigation QAPP – SAP, Rev. 1	HDR	1494	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
21.2	24-May-21	Final MW-87 Area Investigation Work Plan Addendum Technical Memorandum	HDR	1525	
21.2	1-Jan-24	Dunn Field West Vapor Intrusion Sampling and Analysis Plan, Revision 1	HDR	1599	
22		Base Realignment and Closure Documents			
22	1-May-95	SOW, Draft, EBS at BRAC 95 Installations	Environmental Science and Engineering, Inc.	109	
22	1-Aug-96	Environmental Baseline Survey (EBS), Radiological Survey	Defense Distribution Depot Memphis TN	175	
22	1-Sep-96	Final Environmental Assessment for Master Interim Lease at DDDM	Tetra Tech/U.S. Army Corps of Engineers Mobile District	1457	
22	4-Sep-96	Woodward-Clyde Letter to Depot Concerning Comment Response Package for Draft EBS	Geoffrey C. Compeau, Woodward-Clyde Federal Services	179	
22	1-Oct-96	USEPA BRAC Report, Sep-Oct 96	Dann J. Spariosu Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	186	
22	6-Nov-96	Environmental Baseline Survey (EBS), Final Report	Woodward-Clyde Federal Services	195	
22	1-Dec-96	Scoping Report from Environmental Assessment Scoping Meeting	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, Mobile District	1456	
22	1-May-97	Memphis Depot Redevelopment Plan	The Pathfinders	1452	
22	1-May-97	BRAC Sampling Program Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	244	
22	1-Jun-97	A Cultural Resources Inventory and Assessment at Defense Distribution Depot Memphis, TN	TRC Mariah Associates, Inc.	1453	
22	1-Nov-97	Archeological Survey of Two Parcels Defense Distribution Depot Memphis, TN	Prewitt and Associates, Inc.	1454	
22	1-Mar-98	EA, Disposal and Reuse of Depot	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District Tetra Tech, Inc.	290	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
22	1-Apr-98	BRAC Parcel Summary Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	301	
22	1-Oct-98	Revised Final BRAC Parcel Summary Report	CH2M Hill, Inc.	1455	
22	13-Jun-01	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning FOST 2	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	650	
22	4-Feb-03	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Proposed Category Changes for Environmental Condition Property	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	745	
22	7-Jul-04	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Concurrence of Draft FOST No. 3	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	795	
22	10-May-10	Record of Environmental Consideration, Final Transfer of Parcels, Defense Distribution Depot Memphis Tennessee	Michael Dobbs, Defense Distribution Center	1038	
22	26-May-10	Superfund Property Reuse Evaluation Checklist for Reporting the Site wide Ready for Anticipated Use GPRA Measure	Arthur Collins, Chief, Federal Facilities Branch, U.S. Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1041	
22	17-Sep-10	DLA Letter to DAIM-ODB Regarding Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) between Army material Command (AMC) and Defense Logistics Agency (DLA) for Disposal of AMC-Owned, DLA-Operated Base Closure Properties dated August 25, 1995	Michael Dobbs, Defense Distribution Center	1052	
22	2-Apr-20	Recertification of Environmental Condition of Property (ECP) for Parcels 060092 00045 and 060092 00047 on the Main Installation, Former Defense Depot Memphis Tennessee (DDMT)	Hutton, Joan CALIBRE Systems, Inc.	1491	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
23		Findings Of Suitability to Transfer (FOST)/Transfer Deeds			
23.1		Findings Of Suitability to Transfer (FOST)			
23.1	7-Jun-00	Final FOST 1, Main Installation	P.S. Morris, Department of Army, Deputy Chief of Staff for Engineering, Housing, Environment, and Installation Logistics	586	
23.1	27-Sep-01	Final FOST 2, Main Installation	Christopher J. Young Department of Army, Deputy Chief of Staff for Installation	635	
23.1	1-Jul-04	Final FOST 3	Thomas E. Lederle, Director, Base Realignment and Closure, Hampton Field Office	831	
23.1	1-Mar-05	Final FOST 4, Dunn Field	Thomas E. Lederle Director, Base Realignment and Closure, Hampton Field Office	825	
23.1	19-Apr-05	USEPA Letter to Depot Concerning Concurrence with FOST 4, Dunn Field	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	828	
23.1	13-Nov-09	USEPA Letter to DES-DDC-EE Concerning Extension Notice for Review of FOST 5	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1008	
23.1	1-Mar-10	USEPA Letter Regarding Approval of FOST 5	Turpin Ballard U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, Region 4	1564	
23.1	24-May-10	USEPA Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Concurrence with FOST 6	Turpin Ballard Environmental Protection Agency Region IV	1040	

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
23.1	10-Jun-10	TDEC Letter to DDC-DES-EE Regarding Approval of FOST 6	Jamie Woods, Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation	1043	
23.1	1-Jul-10	Final FOST 5	Davis Addison IV, Deputy Assistant Secretary of Army	1046	
23.1	1-Aug-10	Final FOST 6	Thomas E. Lederle, Director, Base Realignment and Closure, Hampton Field Office	1049	
23.2		Transfer Deeds			
23.2	15-Apr-02	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 02065495 U.S. Army to City of Memphis (Police)	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.1
23.2	12-Jun-02	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 02097802 U.S. Army to Depot Redevelopment Corporation	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.2
23.2	18-Jan-06	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 06010341 U.S. Army to Alpha Omega Veterans Services	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.3
23.2	23-Jan-06	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 06013051 U.S. Army to City of Memphis (Hays ROW)	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.4
23.2	19-May-06	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 06080130 U.S. Army to Depot Redevelopment Corporation	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.5
23.2	31-May-06	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 06086149 U.S. Army/Department of Interior to City of Memphis (Golf Course)	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.6
23.2	24-Oct-07	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 07163218 U.S. Army to Dunn Field Business Park LLC	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.7
23.2	13-Apr-14	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 11036907 U.S. Army to Depot Redevelopment Corporation	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.8
23.2	17-Sep-20	Quitclaim Deed Instrument 20100579 U.S. Army to Depot Redevelopment Corporation	U.S. Army Corps of Engineers - Mobile District		23.2.9

IR Section	DATE	SUBJECT or TITLE	AUTHOR	AR#	IR#
24	1-Apr-97	Finding of Suitability to Lease 1	Fatz, Raymond J. Deputy Assistant Secretary of the Army (Enviroinment, Safety, and Occupational Health)	1458	
24	5-Nov-97	Finding of Suitability to Lease 2	Richardson, Earle Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1459	
24	20-May-98	Finding of Suitability to Lease 3	Morris, P. S. Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1460	
24	8-Jul-98	Finding of Suitability to Lease 4	Morris, P. S. Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1461	
24	8-Jul-98	Finding of Suitability to Lease 5	Morris, P. S. Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1462	
24	8-Jul-98	Finding of Suitability to Lease 6	Morris, P. S. Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1463	
24	26-Oct-98	Finding of Suitability to Lease 7	Morris, P. S. Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1464	
24	1-Jul-99	Finding of Suitability to Lease 8	Morris, P. S. Col U.S. Army Materiel Command	1465	
24		Findings of Suitability to Lease (FOSL)			
25		Quality Assurance/Quality Control Plans			
25	1-Sep-95	Generic Quality Assurance Project Plan	CH2M Hill, Inc.	127	
25	1-Nov-05	Remedial Action Sampling and Analysis Plan Volume II: Quality Assurance Project Plan	MACTEC Engineering and Consulting, Inc.	877	
25	1-Dec-14	Remedial Action Operations and Long Term Monitoring Quality Assurance Project Plan, Rev. 1	HDR	1126	
26		Boring Logs And Well Diagrams			
26	-	Main Installation Boring Logs	-		26.1
26	-	Main Installation Well Diagrams	-		26.2
26	_	Dunn Field Boring Logs	-		26.3
26	-	Dunn Field Well Diagrams	-		26.4